CODE REVISER USE ONLY

PROPOSED RULE MAKING OFFICE OF THE CODE REVISER
STATE OF WASHINGTON
FILED
DATE: D ber 24, 2019
CR-102 (December 2017) TIME: g;?;TMEF
(Implements RCW 34.05.320)
Do NOT use for expedited rule making WSR 20-02-057

Agency: Washington State Building Code Council

Original Notice
1 Supplemental Notice to WSR
UJ Continuance of WSR

Preproposal Statement of Inquiry was filed as WSR 19-06-073 ; or

1 Expedited Rule Making--Proposed notice was filedas WSR _____; or
[ Proposal is exempt under RCW 34.05.310(4) or 34.05.330(1); or

[ Proposal is exempt under RCW ____ .

Title of rule and other identifying information: (describe subject) WAC 51-51, Amendments of the 2018 International
Residential Code.

Hearing location(s):

Date: Time: Location: (be specific) Comment:
March 13, 2020 10:00 am |Department of Enterprise
Services

Presentation Room (1213)
1500 Jefferson Street
Olympia, WA 98504

Date of intended adoption: April 10, 2020 (Note: This is NOT the effective date)

Submit written comments to:

Name: Doug Orth

Address: 1500 Jefferson St SE, Olympia, WA 98504
Email: SBCC@des.wa.gov

Fax:

Other:

By (date) March 6, 2020

Assistance for persons with disabilities:
Contact Carrie Toebbe

Phone: 360-407-9255

Fax:

TTY:

Email: carrie.toebbe@des.wa.gov

Other:

By (date) March 6, 2020

Purpose of the proposal and its anticipated effects, including any changes in existing rules:
The proposed rules address proposed state amendments to the 2018 edition of the International Residential
Code, published by the International Code Council, as adopted by the Washington State Building Code Council.
The rules will provide increased clarity and life safety measures for building construction in Washington State.

SUMMARY OF PROPOSED CHANGES

Page 1 of 11



2018 IRC
Amendments to WAC 51-51*

WAC

Section

Changes in 2018

Discussion

51-51-020

Definitions

Deleted definition for Air-Impermeable
Insulation

Defined Balanced Whole House Ventilation

New

Defined Battery System, Stationary Storage

Clerical — This was an approved
definition but is included here
because this definition had an
effective date of July 1, 2020 and
only one group of modifications to a
WAC can have the same effective
date.

Defined Building, Existing

Clerical — This was an approved
definition but is included here
because this definition had an
effective date of July 1, 2020 and
only one group of modifications to a
WAC can have the same effective
date.

Defined Building

Clerical — This was an approved
definition but is included here
because this definition had an
effective date of July 1, 2020 and
only one group of modifications to a
WAC can have the same effective
date.

Defined Distributed Whole House
Ventilation

New

Modified the definition for Dwelling Unit

Clerical — This was an approved
change but is included here because
this change had an effective date of
July 1, 2020 and only one group of
modifications to a WAC can have the
same effective date.

Defined Egress Roof Access Window

Clerical — This was an approved
definition but is included here
because this definition had an
effective date of July 1, 2020 and
only one group of modifications to a
WAC can have the same effective
date.

Defined Energy Storage Systems (ESS)

Clerical — This was an approved
definition but is included here
because this definition had an
effective date of July 1, 2020 and
only one group of modifications to a
WAC can have the same effective
date.

10

Defined Floor Area

Clerical — This was an approved
definition but is included here
because this definition had an

Page 2 of 11




effective date of July 1, 2020 and
only one group of modifications to a
WAC can have the same effective
date.

11

Defined Landing Platform

Clerical — This was an approved
definition but is included here
because this definition had an
effective date of July 1, 2020 and
only one group of modifications to a
WAC can have the same effective
date.

12

Defined Local Exhaust

New

13

Defined Lot

Clerical — This was an approved
definition but is included here
because this definition had an
effective date of July 1, 2020 and
only one group of modifications to a
WAC can have the same effective
date.

14

Defined Lot Line

Clerical — This was an approved
definition but is included here
because this definition had an
effective date of July 1, 2020 and
only one group of modifications to a
WAC can have the same effective
date.

15

Defined Sleeping Loft

Clerical — This was an approved
definition but is included here
because this definition had an
effective date of July 1, 2020 and
only one group of modifications to a
WAC can have the same effective
date.

16

Defined Townhouse

Modification addressing exposure to
yard or public way.

17

Defined Townhouse Unit

Clerical — This was an approved
definition but is included here
because this definition had an
effective date of July 1, 2020 and
only one group of modifications to a
WAC can have the same effective
date.

18

51-51-1505

1505 Mechanical
ventilation

Amendment renumbered from M1505.1 to
M1503.2.1

Clerical

19

M1505.4.1 System
design

Addresses ERV/HRVs. Requires ducted
outdoor air.

Modified model code language

20

M1505.4.1.1 Whole
house system
component
requirements

Addresses efficiency and sound rating
requirements with exceptions

New text

21

M1505.4.1.2 Exhaust
fans

Addresses requirements including ducting
directly to the outside

New text

Page 3 of 11




22 M1505.4.1.3 Supply | Addresses requirements New text
fans.
23 M1505.4.1.4 Addresses requirements New text
Balanced whole
house ventilation
system
24 M1505.4.1.5 Furnace | Prohibits space heating and/or cooling air New text
integrated supply handler fans for outdoor air supply
distribution with a n exception
25 M1505.4.1.6 Testing | Addresses requirements. Allows building New text
official to require testing by a third party.
26 M1505.4.1.7 Requires a posted permanent compliance New text
Certificate certificate
27 M1505.4.2 System Addresses control requirements Modified model code language
controls
28 M1505.4.3 Gives a minimum CFM per dwelling unit Modified model code language
Mechanical
ventilation rate
29 Table M1505.4.3(1) Modifies ranges and airflow requirements. Modified model code table
Whole House
mechanical
ventilation airflow
rate
30 M1505.4.3.1 Addresses minimum whole house New text
Ventilation quality ventilation rate formula adjustments
adjustment
31 Table M1505.4.3(2) Addresses balanced and not balanced New table
System coefficient
32 M1505.4.3.2 Controls must provide for intermittent off New text
Intermittent off operation
operation
33 Table M1505.4.3(3) Modifies segments Modified model code table
Intermittent off
whole house
mechanical
ventilation rate
factors
34 M1505.4.4 Local Clarifies reference Clarification
exhaust rates
35 M1505.4.4.1 Local Addresses bathrooms, toilet rooms and Modified model code language
exhaust kitchens.
36 M1505.4.4.2 Whole Addresses combining local exhaust with New text
house exhaust whole house ventilation system.
controls
37 Table M1505.4.4(1) Addresses bathrooms, toilet rooms and Modified model code language
Minimum local kitchens.
exhaust rates
38 M1505.4.4.3 Local Addresses requirements New text

exhaust fans

Page 4 of 11




39 Table M1505.4.4(2) Addresses exhaust duct sizing New table
Prescriptive exhaust

duct sizing

40 51-51-1507 | Section - Mechanical | Reserved Section renumbered in model code
ventilation Moved to 1505.

41 M1507.1 General Deleted See Section 1505

42 M1507.2 Deleted See Section 1505

Recirculation of air

43 M1507.3 Whole Deleted See Section 1505
house mechanical
ventilation system

a4 M1507.4 Local Moved to M1505.5 Move
exhaust
45 Table M1507.4 Moved to Table M1505.5 Moved

Minimum required
local exhaust rates

46 M1507.4.1 Local Moved to M1505.5.1 Moved
exhaust fans

47 M1507.4.2 Local Moved to M1505.5.2 Moved
exhaust controls

48 P2904.1.1 Required Addresses Uninhabitable attics Changes “attic” to “uninhabitable
sprinkler locations attics”.

Reasons supporting proposal:
To coordinate sections of the International Residential Code with adopted amendments to the International

Mechanical Code to avoid conflicting regulations as well as to make additional modifications to coordinate
adopted amendments in the IRC.

Statutory authority for adoption: 19.27.031, 19.27.074

Statute being implemented: 19.27.031, 19.27.074

Is rule necessary because of a:

Federal Law? O Yes No
Federal Court Decision? O Yes No
State Court Decision? O Yes No

If yes, CITATION:

Agency comments or recommendations, if any, as to statutory language, implementation, enforcement, and fiscal
matters: None

Name of proponent: (person or organization) State Building Code Council ] Private
0] Public
Governmental

Page 5 of 11




Name of agency personnel responsible for:

Name Office Location Phone
Drafting: Richard Brown 1500 Jefferson St. SE, Olympia, WA 98504 360-407-9277
Implementation:  Richard Brown 1500 Jefferson St. SE, Olympia, WA 98504 360-407-9277
Enforcement: Local Jurisdictions Having
Authority
Is a school district fiscal impact statement required under RCW 28A.305.135? L] Yes No

If yes, insert statement here:

The public may obtain a copy of the school district fiscal impact statement by contacting:
Name:
Address:
Phone:
Fax:
TTY:
Email:
Other:

Is a cost-benefit analysis required under RCW 34.05.3287

Yes: A preliminary cost-benefit analysis may be obtained by contacting:
Name: Richard Brown
Address: 1500 Jefferson St. SE, Olympia, WA 98504
Phone: 360-407-9277
Fax:
TTY:
Email: Richard.brown@des.wa.gov
Other:

I No: Please explain:

Regulatory Fairness Act Cost Considerations for a Small Business Economic Impact Statement:

This rule proposal, or portions of the proposal, may be exempt from requirements of the Regulatory Fairness Act (see
chapter 19.85 RCW). Please check the box for any applicable exemption(s):

I This rule proposal, or portions of the proposal, is exempt under RCW 19.85.061 because this rule making is being
adopted solely to conform and/or comply with federal statute or regulations. Please cite the specific federal statute or
regulation this rule is being adopted to conform or comply with, and describe the consequences to the state if the rule is not
adopted.

Citation and description:

] This rule proposal, or portions of the proposal, is exempt because the agency has completed the pilot rule process
defined by RCW 34.05.313 before filing the notice of this proposed rule.

U This rule proposal, or portions of the proposal, is exempt under the provisions of RCW 15.65.570(2) because it was
adopted by a referendum.

] This rule proposal, or portions of the proposal, is exempt under RCW 19.85.025(3). Check all that apply:

O RCW 34.05.310 (4)(b) d RCW 34.05.310 (4)(e)
(Internal government operations) (Dictated by statute)
O RCW 34.05.310 (4)(c) d RCW 34.05.310 (4)(f)
(Incorporation by reference) (Set or adjust fees)
O RCW 34.05.310 (4)(d) O RCW 34.05.310 (4)(9)
(Correct or clarify language) ((i) Relating to agency hearings; or (ii) process
requirements for applying to an agency for a license
or permit)

U This rule proposal, or portions of the proposal, is exempt under RCW
Explanation of exemptions, if necessary:

COMPLETE THIS SECTION ONLY IF NO EXEMPTION APPLIES
If the proposed rule is not exempt, does it impose more-than-minor costs (as defined by RCW 19.85.020(2)) on businesses?

Page 6 of 11




0 No Briefly summarize the agency’s analysis showing how costs were calculated.

Yes Calculations show the rule proposal likely imposes more-than-minor cost to businesses, and a small business
economic impact statement is required. Insert statement here:

There are costs imposed by the proposed rules but the costs do not fall disproportionately on small

businesses. These rules will not affect the distribution of impacted work, whether by small businesses or not,

doing the work. The rules do not affect employment, reporting or record keeping.

Small Business Economic Impact Statement (RCW 19.85.040)

Description

The Washington State Building Code Council (SBCC) is filing a proposed rule to adopt the updated 2018 edition of the International
Residential Code (IRC) (WAC 51-51). Since 1985 the state building code council has been responsible to update to new editions of the
building code per RCW 19.27.074. The IRC is updated every three years by the International Code Council (ICC). The code development
process conducted by the model code organization is open to all interest groups within the design and construction industry and from
governmental organizations. See www.iccsafe.org for more information about the model code development process.

The administrative compliance requirements are under the authority of the local government. RCW19.27.050. Compliance activities
including permit issuance, plan review and approval, and inspections occur at the local level. Requirements for construction document
submittal and other reporting requirements are determined by the local jurisdiction and are consistent with previously established
policies. The proposed amendments to WAC 51-51 include specific technical requirements for building construction to be consistent
with national standards.

Professional Services

Washington has had a statewide building code in effect since 1974. The local enforcement authority having jurisdiction administers the
codes through the building and/or fire departments. Administrative procedures for state building code compliance are established and
will not be changed by the adoption of the update to the current building codes. Small businesses will employ the same types of
professional services for the design and construction of buildings and systems to comply with the state building code.

The proposed rule updates the state building code and does not require additional equipment, supplies, labor or other services. Services
needed to comply with the building code are existing within the construction industry as required by the local authority having
jurisdiction.

Costs of Compliance for Businesses

The cost of compliance incurred by Washington businesses includes training and educational materials. The IRC 2018 model code costs
$99 + tax shipping and handling. This publication is also available on line at http://codes.iccsafe.org/l-Codes.html. The ICC chapters offer
training for continuing education credits to architects, engineers and building inspectors for $285 (in 2016).

The Building Code technical advisory group (TAG) determined there is a cost for compliance on businesses for the following proposed
state amendments.

1. All proposed changes to section M1505 will result in an estimated $1.20/square foot ($950/dwelling unit — multi-family only)
with an anticipated full system payback in 11.2 years.

Loss of Sales or Revenue

Businesses with new products or updated test or design standards are recognized in the updated building code.

The update will result in some cost outlay for some small businesses for specific building projects, for a transition period. Other small
businesses would see an increase in revenue. The amendments to all the building codes affect over 25,000 (in 2012) small businesses in
the state, where construction activity occurs. The primary intent of these amendments are to improve energy eficiency in buildings and
provide consistency and fairness across the state, for a predictable business environment. The amendments should result in enhanced
value in buildings.

Cost of Compliance for Small Businesses (Determine whether the proposed rule will have a disproportionate cost impact on small
businesses, compare the cost of compliance for small business with the cost of compliance for the ten percent of businesses that are the
largest businesses.)

The majority of businesses affected by the updates to the building codes are small businesses; over 95 percent of those listed in the
construction and related industries have under 50 employees. The costs per employee are comparable between the largest businesses
and the majority of small businesses. The cost to comply with the updated codes is not a disproportionate impact on small business.
Where the Council found the cost of compliance for small businesses to be disproportionate, the proposed rule mitigates the cost. The
proposed rules include a definition of small business and provide exceptions for compliance with the updated rule.

Reducing the Costs of the Rule on Small Businesses

The SBCC conducted a detailed review process, including participation at the national code development hearings, to document
significant economic impacts of the proposed code amendments.

Page 7 of 11



http://codes.iccsafe.org/I-Codes.html

Small Businesses Involved in the Development of the Rule

For the IRC, the SBCC conducted 10 open public meetings of the building code technical advisory group, available via telephone
conference bridge and over the internet, and allowed comment on every item on every agenda. For the IRC TAG the SBCC appointed 6
representatives of all segments of the business and construction community to serve on the technical advisory groups.

List of Industries
Below is a list of industries required to comply with the building code:

North
American
Industry
Classifica- Number of
tion Establish- 1% of 0.3% of
System ments in AVG Avg Avg
(NAICS) NAICS Code Washington | TOTAL Annual TOTAL Annual AVG Annual | Annual Annual Annual
Code Definition State Payroll Revenue Payroll Revenue Payroll Revenue
New single-
family housing
construction
(except for-sale
236115 | builders) 1261 $186,272,000 $147,718 $1,477
New multifamily
housing
construction
(except for-sale
236116 | builders) 45 $54,622,000 -~ | $1,213,822 — | $12,138
Residential
236118 | remodelers 2777 $318,180,000 | $1,536,217,000 $114,577 $553,193 $1,146 $1,660
Industrial
building
236210 | construction 53 (s) $99,790,000
Commercial and
institutional
building
236220 | construction 862 $772,473,000 | $6,925,925,000 $896,140 | $8,034,716 $8,961 $24,104
Poured concrete
foundation and
structure
238110 | contractors 511 $144,643,000 $479,256,000 $283,059 $937,879 $2,831 $2,814
Structural steel
and precast
concrete
238120 | contractors 68 $93,454,000 | $336,100,000 | $1,374,324 | $4,942,647 | $13,743 | $14,828
Framing
238130 | contractors 417 $79,196,000 $279,226,000 $189,918 $669,607 $1,899 $2,009
Masonry
238140 | contractors 293 $74,067,000 $215,274,000 $252,788 $734,724 $2,528 $2,204
Glass and glazing
238150 | contractors 141 $67,626,000 $237,985,000 $479,617 | $1,687,837 $4,796 $5,064
Roofing
238160 | contractors 537 $179,942,000 $660,911,000 $335,088 | $1,230,747 $3,351 $3,692
Siding
238170 | contractors 327 $58,557,000 $286,471,000 $179,073 $876,058 $1,791 $2,628

Page 8 of 11




238190

Other
foundation,
structure, and
building exterior
contractors

113

$37,585,000

$123,771,000

$332,611

$1,095,319

$3,326

$3,286

238210

Electrical
contractors and
other wiring
installation
contractors

1847

$940,854,000

$3,026,762,000

$509,396

$1,638,745

$5,094

$4,916

238220

Plumbing,
heating, and air-
conditioning
contractors

1664

$959,976,000

$3,169,548,000

$576,909

$1,904,776

$5,769

$5,714

238290

Other building
equipment
contractors

81

$117,696,000

$1,453,037

$14,530

238310

Drywall and
insulation
contractors

653

$282,929,000

$723,945,000

$433,276

$1,108,644

$4,333

$3,325

238990

All other
specialty trade
contractors

547

$182,710,000

$573,308,000

$334,022

$1,048,095

$3,340

$3,144

321213

Engineered wood

member (except
truss)
manufacturing

11

$14,216,000

$79,051,000

$1,292,364

$7,186,455

$12,924

$21,559

321214

Truss
manufacturing

22

321219

Reconstituted
wood product
manufacturing

321911

Wood window
and door
manufacturing

39

$37,814,000

$145,137,000

$969,590

$3,721,462

$9,696

$11,164

321992

Prefabricated
wood building
manufacturing

18

$6,891,000

$382,833

$382,833

327310

Cement
manufacturing

327320

Ready-mix
concrete
manufacturing

93

$74,457,000

$800,613

$8,006

327331

Concrete block
and brick
manufacturing

18

$11,218,000

$623,222

$6,232

332311

Prefabricated
metal building
and component
manufacturing

$3,564,000

$396,000

$3,960

Page 9 of 11




332312

Fabricated
structural metal
manufacturing

94

$125,755,000

$1,337,819

$13,378

332321

Metal window
and door
manufacturing

16

$23,776,000

$1,486,000

$14,860

332322

Sheet metal work
manufacturing

122

$122,956,000

$573,443,000

$1,007,836

$4,700,352

$10,078

$14,101

335121

Residential
electric lighting
fixture
manufacturing

335122

Commercial,
industrial, and
institutional
electric lighting
fixture
manufacturing

$2,625,000

$328,125

$3,281

335129

Other lighting
equipment
manufacturing

423720

Plumbing and
heating
equipment and
supplies
(hydronics)
merchant
wholesalers

168

$82,225,000

$897,748,000

$489,435

$5,343,738

$4,894

$16,031

541310

Architectural
services

635

$326,798,000

$921,033,000

$514,643

$1,450,446

$5,146

$4,351

541330

Engineering
services

1599

$1,758,825,000

$3,946,553,000

$1,099,953

$2,468,138

$11,000

$7,404

541350

Building
inspection
services

154

$9,724,000

$28,297,000

$63,143

$183,747

$631

$551

561621

Security systems
services (except
locksmiths)

109

$86,072,000

$233,388,000

$789,651

$2,141,174

$7,897

$6,424

Note: Data is blank in some fields to protect data source.

Data Source: Economic Census of the United States

Estimate of the Number of Jobs That Will Be Created or Lost

The adoption of these amendments is not expected to significantly impact the number of jobs in the construction industry. These rules
are likely to be job neutral overall, i.e., they will not result in any job gains or losses. The scheduled effective date of amendments is July
1, 2020. Building permits issued prior to that date will be vested under the 2015 building code. Permits issued for projects under the
2018 code edition will generally start with the 2021 construction season.

The public may obtain a copy of the small business economic impact statement or the detailed cost calculations by

contacting:

Name: Richard Brown

Address: 1500 Jefferson St. SE, Olympia, WA 98504

Page 10 of 11




Phone: 360-407-9277

Fax:

TTY:

Email: Richard.brown@des.wa.gov
Other:

Sighature:
Date: December 24, 2019

Name: Doug Orth %
Title: Council Chair

Page 11 of 11



AMENDATORY SECTION (Amending WSR 16-03-025, filed 1/11/16, effective
7/1/16)

WAC 51-51-0202 Section R202—Definitions.

ADULT FAMILY HOME means a dwelling in which a person or persons provide per-
sonal care, special care, room and board to more than one but not more
than six adults who are not related by blood or marriage to the person
or persons providing the services.

H

DN 2] 42~ N I NS N N I S N NE 2t W ol + B
AIR-IMPERMEABEE—INSUIATION R StHrat oo vIg—aih—aTrFr—peErmeantce—Cgudar—t0—0%
= D =
= \»

arric, HABITABLE. A conditioned area complying with all of the following re-
quirements:

1. The occupiable floor area is at least 70 square feet (6.5 m?),
in accordance with Section R304.

2. The occupiable floor area has a ceiling height in accordance
with Section R305.

3. The occupiable space 1is entirely enclosed by the roof assembly
above, knee walls (if applicable) on the sides, and the floor-ceiling
assembly below.

A habitable attic is not considered a story.

BALANCED WHOLE HOUSE VENTILATION. Balanced whole house ventilation is defined as
any combination of concurrently operating residential unit mechanical
exhaust and mechanical supply whereby the total mechanical exhaust
airflow rate is within 10 percent or 5 cfm, whichever is Jgreater, of
the total mechanical supply airflow rate. Intermittent dryver exhaust,
intermittent range hood exhaust, and intermittent toilet room exhaust
airflow rates above the residential dwelling or sleeping unit minimum
ventilation rate are exempt from the balanced airflow calculation.

BATTERY SYSTEM, STATIONARY STORAGE. This definition is not adopted.

BUILDING, EXISTING. A building or structure erected prior to the adoption of
this code, or one that has passed a final inspection.

BUILDING. Any one— or two-family dwelling or townhouse, or portion there-
of used or intended to be used for human habitation, for 1living,
sleeping, cooking or eating purposes, or any combination thereof, or
any accessory structure.

CHILD CARE, FAaMILY HoME. A child care facility, licensed by Washington state,
located in the dwelling of the person or persons under whose direct
care and supervision the child is placed, for the care of twelve or
fewer children, including children who reside at the home.

cHILD DAY caré, shall, for the purposes of these regulations, mean the care
of children during any period of a 24 hour day.

CONDITIONED SPACE. An area, room or space that is enclosed within the build-
ing thermal envelope and that 1s directly or indirectly heated or
cooled. Spaces are indirectly heated or cooled where they communicate
through openings with conditioned spaces, where they are separated
from conditioned spaces by uninsulated walls, floors or ceilings, or
where they contain uninsulated ducts, piping or other sources of heat-
ing or cooling.

[ 11 0TS-1954.2



DISTRIBUTED WHOLE HOUSE VENTILATION. A whole house ventilation system shall be
considered distributed when it supplies outdoor air directly (not
transfer air) to each dwelling or sleeping unit habitable space (liv-
ing room, den, office, interior adjoining spaces, or bedroom), and ex-
hausts air from all kitchens and bathrooms directly outside.

DWELLING UNIT. A single unit providing complete independent living facili-
ties for one or more persons, including permanent provisions for 1liv-
ing, sleeping, eating, cooking and sanitation. Dwelling units may also
include the following uses:

1. Adult family homes, foster family care homes and family day
care homes licensed by the Washington state department of social and
health services.

2. Offices, mercantile, food preparation for off-site consump-
tion, personal care salons or similar uses which are conducted primar-
ily by the occupants of the dwelling unit and are secondary to the use
of the unit for dwelling purposes, and which do not exceed 500 square

feet (46.4 m?).

2 O PN NI I-NE S TP £ 52N i B IR 2NV RN I = i a o~ PN P IR ENPNE S 2N Ao AN~ A —
e IT & AL wrw e ) - \.A.VV\,_L_L_Lll\_j g Ty WITITCOTTT T OO0 o T Ly CUTTho ITTCTK - oL (=
\ \ \ .
7 -
= il =W NE S DI L SN B B I S S TR - I EIF- NP SN OR SRS R SN~ R S L B i N I TN 2 ERFE S RNy
Tl e J N A By (& e [ - VY _L_L_Ll.l\j I 1T ) U o T OT T oL W I CTITTTT TT _L;_)L_,_LLJ.\:’
érwe—l—l—l—ﬁ-g—ﬁ-ﬁ—:l%.
b Fat+h e + BN TNE LS T LI SN B B I W ST T~ I PP NP NS RN S T £ 2N I IR - T RN I R =
e 1T 1T CTT - T L S\ NPL UL WSS D ) W VY _L_L_LJ.J.\j U I Ny Ry Wy - L./J__I_J.I.I.(_/LJ_ A\ A _L_L_LJ.J.\j % N A Ry Ju )
PICTENPNE A A A
OWIT - Ay \ALJ_L e
o A1 ] oy Al amal ~1 N 1 + PNV INE VS TR L0 PN B B I AW T RN I~ ~ o~ A
. JF A W E J_\./\-iu_LJ_\./kA [SF 5 AW ) wy IO ITTINS 1T T L 5\ UL WL WSS e ) W VY _L_L_Ll.l\j T 1T T
+ PN RN S T LN B I IR - B 2N I ~R NP A SN N S AT = B I T T ENE NN N NP 2SI~ SN SR
CTT tIJ__LJ.I.I.(_/LJ__Y kA.VV\_,_L_L_LJ.J.g U I N Ry Wy % e T TTC - OTITT | oL Q1T O O T (=5 ITTOTTT T O 1 CITT T CTIT
TSR EINE I HP G + n N N PN e i B | T T ~ 117 N N = 1T e+ +h P NS )
T C OO T ITUTT . 1T LT ITIT A/ S (=5 |SP E vy @ Ny wy | g O N Ey @ i iy ) 4 WS ) [ S OO0 CTT CTT f/J__LlI.I.L/LJ_
P e N B B N T TR NE I SR NE SN T S 2N PN NI NE VS F RN e N B B IR NP TR N I
A\ _L_L_LJ.J.\j T 1T Sy Lw s CTT (=5 [ AW g my AVY _L_L_LJ.J.\j T 1T T e

EGRESS ROOF AcCEss WiNDow. A skvlight or roof window designed and installed to
satisfy the emergency escape and rescue opening requirements of Sec-
tion R310.2.

ENERGY STORAGE SYSTEMS (Ess). One or more devices, assembled together, capable
of storing energy in order to supply electrical energy at a future
time.

FIRE SEPARATION DISTANCE. The distance measured from the foundation wall or
face of the wall framing, whichever is closer, to one of the follow-
ing:

1. To the closest interior lot line; or

2. To the centerline of a street, an alley or public way; or

3. To an imaginary line between two buildings on the lot.

The distance shall be measured at a right angle from the wall.

FLOOR AREA. The area within the inside perimeter of exterior walls of the
building. The floor area of a building, or portion thereof, not provi-
ded with surrounding exterior walls shall be the usable area under the
horizontal projection of the roof or floor above.

1anDING praTForM. A landing provided as the top step of a stairway accessing
a sleeping loft.

LOCAL EXHAUST. An exhaust system that uses one or more fans to exhaust air
from a specific room or rooms within a residential dwelling or sleep-—
ing unit.

or. A measured portion or parcel of land considered as a unit having
fixed boundaries.

[ 2 ] 0TS-1954.2



The line which bounds a plot of ground described as a 1ot in

the title to the property.

LOT LINE.

between the floor and

level or levels

intermediate

An
ceiling of any story.

LOFT.

MEZZANINE,

SALT WATER COASTAL AREA. Those areas designated as salt water coastal areas by

the local jurisdiction.

A sleeping space on a floor level located more than 30 in-—

(726 _mm)
more sides with a ceiling height of less than 6 feet 8 inches

SLEEPING LOFT.

ches

above the main floor and open to the main floor one or

(2032

COor-—

which is owned and oper-

Any business entity (including a sole proprietorship,

partnership or other legal entity)

SMALL BUSINESS.
poration,

which has the purpose of

ated independently from all other businesses,

making a profit,

and which has fifty or fewer employees.

A building that

attached townhouse

three or more

contains
units in which each unit extends from foundation to roof.

TOWNHOUSE .

Fach single-

family dwelling unit shall have a yard or public way on not less than

two sides that extends at least 50 percent of the length of each of

these two sides.

A single—-family dwelling unit in a townhouse that extends

from foundation to roof and that has a vard or public way on not less

TOWNHOUSE UNIT.

than two sides that extends at least 50 percent of the length of each

of these two sides.

WHOLE HOUSE VENTILATION SYSTEM.

controls,

including fans,

A mechanical ventilation system,
which replaces, '

alr from the habitable rooms with outdoor air.

means,

))

((

by direct

and ducts,

0] |
> ]
- (1]
D Nel
53
4 =
4
0] —_
©
—
~
—
—
~
—
o}
0]
l
-
(o
o
AN
O
I
™
(@) ~
I -~
O
— _
o
k 0
= S
o
28
- i
i L
S 3}
m Q
& (&)
= o
m 10
2 D
m —
0 D
—
> To}
5
B ~ A
L[ =
Af —
=~
| —
S~
| ™~

ical ventilation.

et o 1

T

D s, A, I N gy

r

Noan ot e I~
M g rnan +h e ~ler
T T T IO

P

m
DOTIT

+a1

|

=3
(A AQEN

T+ o

T v e
+ 1

[ i ¥ & ym mpm my

TOIT LT CO

T

O C L O

L= T30

mim

Ik
T CTT

£ A A1 857
O AR A

oo

-
T

1 /4

hoasza mex

oot

Tt/

AV,

O 0

CIT T COISTT

LluV_LLl\j
w1+

¥ ACATAw v

IO C

S A
o

ot n

D
T aIrce

4 o ol

(&

1Tnoh
T CTT

\

2Q oo

(NI

T

| ¥ aws

T TTWTTTT

e

Tt/

TO—=7

\ W3 Awar

alanraor

+ o

ol

raaA combhitat 21 mat g o
[ SRS B W § UM ONo T 101 T T T

13~ A
Csnavs
+h o

+ 1

T

CTOoOoTIIC To .

T

S S @ g

T

CIT

led ey
[A==as]

mad g~ Ay "

=] (610 e ah 11 2N
O T Ottty

EIESNE 2N

2/

oo

A\

LS B By
aha1]
PR A WAWAW § [ 2 NN Ny & R S

o rrrcaoa ot OoT TwWTTTT

oT

[} &y mp

CIITort T TITCTIIC O

OO

n

12N
©

ra 1 PN ENE IR N = Th
A\

PN
[ 4 & N UPL NP S iy @ R )

A+ comliniaat 21T
UM OO T 1010

[CTyaws

P,
[ ) San =y & §

TTIoT

. T

T

OO Tt

I

PR I =
L/lJ.J._LL_,,

PN I
—IT I 1T

PR I =
LA.LJ._LL,,

w1 AEh £ + 1 NN
LA/ SN R W i |\ CIT

+1n

+hh o

o
OO

o | ¥ aws

o1

F¥awy

T

[\ W e

CIT

CIrort

+ 1

Al aanlhh o

A\ =y

nIz by
2T RATE Y Ay

i1 1 A4 o~~~
[Sjv ==y =T

+ 1

CIT

Gt
[ S N D E W B )

At~ A

| ¥ aws

(e

Ty

[ 3 ) &y mp g

T CaoctCt
| 12N
T

WTT

[Cryaw s

o

S

m

TTr

+~
CTIICTT

+~

Aama

hacledro £4
oT

-
T

1 +h
W LT CTT

TR IS N |
CqUTIPPCE

o
EEEANE I T I SIS
S SN N A N E N WS Sy & i W

A
A\ AW I WA B WA W s S )

O Lo

STt o T

E) AW i iy & i gy

o

PO S

3

+
DT O T T

ot o
t/\./J_L/LL,_L
o A
AT

n

3

whan

WTT

n

Fa 1+t o
1T

n

nt
A\ I R o iy e

o

T —oirrco
~ £

T

T

i E E gy S By & R W iy

7

1t

1

NN

] 4 ot~
T 10 C T

=AY

gral hatrat  cszad o

Ay

PN IENE S CNANE SN I SN
UJ_t/UJ_(.AL_,_LJ.J.v

3

— O

TaotCTCT

Oy o C oIttty [STyaws

IO C

TTIrcog Lo

LT

s

A

EEESNP Sa N |

N+ <7

I

i

PN I~
T 1TC0
+ 1

21

e
P e e

oot

Y

13

w1 +h

LTI o CTOO 11T T
leaat
T O To O

T rtCIre Ty
ledrmer o
oo L ot
A

T
NAAYEANE =230

oL
A oz~

T

R avAvAw ¥
mn

TTCT OO O
.
\,J.J.V\/_Lut/\/
£ o -

ot
hita 1 A3 o~ ~

DO TOTig
n

W CIrooc
+ 1
TTT

194+ 2 A
A\ A I ye sy w 5
[~ WaXli

o

n
Tt

oz
M1505.4 Whole-house mechanical ventilation system.

T T

n
TTIoCT

n

213 ey
T G7

| ¥ aws
o

vV 1y
rat~A
ot

IR RN
o o CTTT

+~

TIoTLr

13

TaL

TOW

=N
©

oot

T v

TTtTT™

\w 8

T

JE g e i g

))

Each dwelling unit shall be eqgquipped with a ventilation system.

1Y A
IEaCACAY ary

IO C

The

0TS-1954.2



whole—-house mechanical ventilation systems shall be designed in ac-—
cordance with Sections M1505.4.1 through M1505.4.4.

M1505.4.1 System design. The whole house ventilation system shall con-
sist of one or more supply fans, one or more exhaust fans, or an
ERV/HRV with integral fans, associated ducts and controls. Whole-house
mechanical ventilation system with supply and exhaust fans per Sec-
tions M1505.4.1.2, M1505.4.1.3, M1505.4.1.4, and M1505.4.1.5. Local
exhaust fans are permitted to serve as part of the whole house venti-
lation system when provided with the proper controls per Section
M1505.4.2. The systems shall be designed and installed to supply and
exhaust the minimum outdoor airflow rates per Section MI1505.4.3 as
corrected by the balanced and/or distributed whole house ventilation
system coefficients per Section M1504.5.3.1 where applicable. The
whole house ventilation system shall operate continuously at the mini-
mum ventilation rate determined per Section MI1505.4.2 unless config-
ured with intermittent off controls per Section MI1505.4.3.2.

M1505.4.1.1 Whole house system component requirements. Whole house
ventilation supply and exhaust fans specified in this section shall
have a minimum efficacy as prescribed in the Washington State Enerqgy
Code. Design and installation of the system or equipment shall be car-
ried out in accordance with manufacturers' installation instructions.
Whole house ventilation fans shall be rated for sound at no less than
the minimum airflow rate required by Section M1505.4.3.1. Ventilation
fans shall be rated for sound at a maximum of 1.0 sone. This sound
rating shall be at a minimum of 0.1 in. w.c. (25 Pa) static pressure
in accordance with HVI procedures specified in Sections M1505.4.1.2
and M1505.4.1.3.

EXCEPTION: HVAC air handlers, ERV/HRV units, and remote mounted fans need not meet the sound requirements. To be considered for this
exception, a remote mounted fan must be mounted outside the habitable spaces, bathrooms, toilets, and hallways, and there must be at

least 4 ft (1 m) of ductwork between the fan and the intake grille.
The whole house supply fan shall provide ducted outdoor ventila-
tion air to each habitable space within the residential unit.

EXCEPTION: Interior joining spaces provided with a 30 cfm whole house transfer fan or a permanent opening with an area of not less than 8 percent
of the floor area of the interior adjoining space but not less than 25 square feet do not require ducted outdoor ventilation air to be
supplied directly to the space. Whole house transfer fans shall meet the sone rating of Section M1505.4.1.1 and shall have whole house
ventilation controls that comply with Section M1505.4.2.

M1505.4.1.2 Exhaust fans. FExhaust fans required shall be ducted di-
rectly to the outside. Exhaust air outlets shall be designed to limit
the pressure difference to the outside to 1limiting the outlet free
area maximum velocity to 500 ft per min and equipped with backdraft
dampers or motorized dampers in accordance with Washington State Ener-
gy Code. Exhaust fans shall be tested and rated in accordance with the
airflow and sound rating procedures of the Home Ventilating Institute
(HVI 915, HVI Loudness Testing and Rating Procedure, HVI 916, HVI Ajir-
flow Test Procedure, and HVI 920, HVI Product Performance Certifica-
tion Procedure). Exhaust fans required in this section may be used to
provide local ventilation. Exhaust fans that are designed for inter-
mittent exhaust airflow rates higher than the continuous exhaust air-
flow rates in Table 403.8.3 shall be provided with occupancy sensors
or humidity sensors to automatically override the fan to the high
speed airflow rate. The exhaust fans shall be tested and the testing
results shall be submitted and posted in accordance with Section
403.8.6.7.

M1505.4.1.3 Supply fans. Supply fans used in meeting the reguirements
of this section shall supply outdoor air from intake openings in ac-
cordance with IMC Sections 401.4 and 401.5. Intake air openings shall

[ 4 1] 0TS-1954.2



be designed to limit the pressure difference to the outside to limit-
ing the intlet free area maximum velocity to 500 ft per min and when
designed for intermittent off operation shall be equipped with motor-
ized dampers in accordance with Washington State Enerqgy Code. Supply
fans shall be tested and rated in accordance with the airflow and
sound rating procedures of the Home Ventilating Institute (HVI 915,
HVI Toudness Testing and Rating Procedure, HVI 916, HVI Airflow Test
Procedure, and HVI 920, HVI Product Performance Certification Proce-
dure) . Where outdoor air is provided to each habitable dwelling unit
or sleeping unit by supply fan systems the outdoor air shall be fil-
tered. The filter shall be accessible for regular maintenance and re-
placement. The filter shall have a Minimum Efficiency Rating Value
(MERV) of at least 8.

M1505.4.1.4 Balanced whole house ventilation system. A balanced whole
house ventilation system shall include both supply and exhaust fans.
The supply and exhaust fans shall have airflow that is within 10 per-
cent of each other. The tested and balanced total mechanical exhaust
airflow rate is within 10 percent or 5 cfm, whichever is greater, of
the total mechanical supply airflow rate. The flow rate test results
shall be submitted and posted in accordance with Section M1505.4.1.7.
The exhaust fan shall meet the requirements of Section MI1505.4.1.2.
The supply fan shall meet the requirements of Section MI1505.4.1.3. For
dwelling units required by the Washington State Energy Code to have a
balanced system, the system is required to have balanced whole house
ventilation but is not required to have distributed whole house venti-—
lation where the distributed system coefficient from Table 403.8.2 is
utilized to correct the whole-house mechanical ventilation rate. In-
termittent dryver exhaust, intermittent range hood exhaust, and inter-
mittent toilet room exhaust airflow rates above the residential dwell-
ing or sleeping unit minimum ventilation rate are exempt from the bal-
anced airflow calculation.

M1505.4.1.5 Furnace integrated supply. Systems using space heating
and/or cooling air handler fans for outdoor air supply distribution
are not permitted.

EXCEPTION: Air handler fans shall have multispeed or variable speed supply airflow control capability with a low speed operation not greater than 25
percent of the rated supply airflow capacity during ventilation only operation. Outdoor air intake openings must meet the provisions of

Sections R303.5 and R303.6 and must include a motorized damper that is activated by the whole house ventilation system controller.
The motorized damper must be controlled to maintain the outdoor airflow intake airflow within 10 percent of the whole house
mechanical exhaust airflow rate. The flow rate for the outdoor air intake must be tested and verified at the minimum ventilation fan
speed and the maximum heating or cooling fan speed. The results of the test shall be submitted and posted in accordance with Section
M1505.4.1.7.

M1505.4.1.6 Testing. Whole-house mechanical ventilation systems shall
be tested, balanced and verified to provide a flow rate not less than
the minimum required by Sections M1505.4.3 and M1505.4.4. Testing
shall be performed according to the ventilation eguipment manufactur-
er's instructions, or by using a flow hood, flow grid, or other air-
flow measuring device at the mechanical ventilation fan's inlet termi-
nals, outlet terminals or grilles or in the connected ventilation
ducts. Where required by the building official, testing shall be con-
ducted by an approved third party. A written report of the results of
the test shall be signed by the party conducting the test and provided
to the building official and be posted in the dwelling unit per Sec-
tion M1505.4.1.7.

M1505.4.1.7 Certificate. A permanent certificate shall be completed by
the mechanical contractor, test and balance contractor or other ap-
proved party and posted on a wall in the space where the furnace is

[ 51 0TS-1954.2



located, a utility room, or an approved location inside the building.
When located on an electrical panel, the certificate shall not cover
or obstruct the visibility of the circuit directory 1label, service
disconnect label, or other required labels. The certificate shall 1list
the flow rate determined from the delivered airflow of the whole-house
mechanical ventilation system as installed and the type of mechanical
whole house ventilation system used to comply with Section
M1505.4.3.1.

M1505.4.2 System controls. The whole-house mechanical ventilation sys-
tem shall be provided with controls that comply with the following:

1. The whole house ventilation system shall be controlled with
manual switches, timers or other means that provide for automatic op-
eration of the ventilation system that are readily accessible by the
occupant;

2. Whole-house mechanical ventilation system shall be provided
with controls that enable manual override off of the system by the oc-
cupant during periods of poor outdoor air quality. Controls shall in-
clude permanent text or a symbol indicating their function. Recommen-
ded control permanent labeling to include text similar to the follow-
ing: "Leave on unless outdoor air quality is very poor." Manual con-
trols shall be readily accessible by the occupant;

3. Whole house ventilation systems shall be configured to operate
continuously except where intermittent off controls and sizing are
provided per Section M1505.4.3.2.

M1505.4.3 Mechanical wventilation rate. The whole-house mechanical ven-
tilation system shall provide outdoor air at a continuous rate as de-
termined in accordance with Table M1505.4.3(1) or Eguation 15-1.

Equation 15-1

Ventilation rate in cubic feet per minute = (0.01 x total sqgquare foot
area of house) + [7.5 x (number of bedrooms + 1)] but not less than 30
cfm for each dwelling unit

Table M1505.4.3(1)
Whole-House Mechanical Ventilation Airflow Rate

Number of Bedrooms
%&g_?;tquare feet) 0-1 2 3 4 S or more
Airflow in c¢fm
<500 30 30 35 45 50
501 - 1,000 30 35 40 50 55
1,001 - 1,500 30 40 45 55 60
1,501 - 2,000 35 45 50 60 65
2,001 - 2,500 40 50 55 65 70
2,501 - 3,000 45 55 60 70 75
3.001 - 3,500 50 60 65 75 80
3.501 - 4,000 55 65 70 80 85
4,001 - 4,500 60 70 75 85 90
4,501 - 5,000 65 75 80 90 95

M1505.4.3.1 Ventilation quality adjustment. The minimum whole house
ventilation rate from Section 1505.4.3 shall be adjusted by the system
coefficient in Table M1505.4.3(2) based on the system type not meeting

[ 6 ] 0TS-1954.2



the definition of a balanced whole house ventilation system and/or not
meeting the definition of a distributed whole house ventilation sys-—
tem.

Q - Qr * Cq_{q‘rom
(Equation 15-2)

Where:
Qu

Q:

Quality-adjusted ventilation airflow rate
in cubic feet per minute (cfm).

Ventilation airflow rate, cubic feet per
minute (cfm) from 15-1 or Table

M1505.4.3(1).

System coefficient from Table

1505.4.3(2).

Table M1505.4.3(2)
System Coefficient (Csystem)

Q;ste.m

System Type Distributed Not Distributed
Balanced 1.0 1.25
Not balanced 1.25 1.5

M1505.4.3.2 Intermittent off operation. Whole-house mechanical venti-
lation systems shall be provided with advanced controls that are con-
figured to operate the system with intermittent off operation shall
operate for a least two hours in each four-hour segment. The whole
house ventilation airflow rate determined in accordance with Section
M1505.4.3 as corrected by Section M1505.4.3.1 is multiplied by the
factor determined in accordance with Table M1505.4.3(3).

Table M1505.4.3(3)
Intermittent Off Whole House-Mechan-

ical Ventilation Rate Factors2/?

Run-time % in Each

4-hour Segment 50% 66% 75% 100%
Factor? 2 15 13 1o

a. For ventilation system run—-time values between those given,
the factors are permitted to be determined by interpolation.
b. Extrapolation bevond the table is prohibited.

M1505.4.4 Local exhaust rates. lLocal exhaust systems shall be designed
to have the capacity to exhaust the minimum airflow rate determined in
accordance with Table M1505.4.4(1). If the local exhaust fan is inclu-
ded in the whole house ventilation system, in accordance with Section
1505.4.1, then the exhaust fan shall be controlled to operate as
specified in Section M1505.4.2.

M1505.4.4.1 Local exhaust. Bathrooms, toilet rooms, and kitchens shall
include a local exhaust system. Such local exhaust systems shall have
the capacity to exhaust the minimum airflow rate in accordance with
Table M1505.4.4(1l). Fans required by this section shall be provided
with controls that enable manual override or automatic occupancy sen-
sor, humidity sensor or pollutant sensor controls. An "on/off" switch
shall meet this requirement for manual controls. Manual fan controls
shall be readily accessible in the room served by the fan.

Table M1505.4.4(1)

[ 71 0TS-1954.2



Minimum Local Exhaust Rates

Exhaust Rates
Area to Be Exhausted Intermittent | Continuous
Kitchens 100 cfim 30 cfm
Bathrooms - Toilet rooms 50 cfim 20 cfm

M1505.4.4.2 Local exhaust fans.
criteria:

1. Exhaust fans shall be tested and rated in accordance with the
airflow and sound rating procedures of the Home Ventilating Institute
(HVI 915, HVI Loudness Testing and Rating Procedure, HVI 916, HVI Air-
flow Test Procedure, and HVI 920, HVI Product Performance Certifica-
tion Procedure).

EXCEPTION:

Exhaust fans shall meet the following

Where a range hood or down draft exhaust fan is used for local exhaust for a kitchen, the device is not required to be rated per these
standards.

2. Fan airflow rating and duct system shall be designed and in-
stalled to deliver at least the exhaust airflow required by Table
M1505.4.4(1). The airflows required refer to the delivered airflow of
the system as installed and tested using a flow hood, flow grid, or
other airflow measurement device. Local exhaust systems shall be tes-
ted, balanced, and verified to provide a flow rate not less than the
minimum required by this section.

3. Design and installation of the system or equipment shall be
carried out in accordance with manufacturers' installation instruc-
tions.

4., Fan airflow rating and duct system shall be designed and in-
stalled

to deliver at least the exhaust airflow regquired by Table
M1505.4.4(1).
EXCEPTIONS: 1. An exhaust airflow rating at a pressure of 0.25 in. w.g. may be used, provided the duct sizing meets the prescriptive requirements of

Table M1505.4.4(2).
2. Where a range hood or down draft exhaust fan is used to satisfy the local ventilation requirements for kitchens, the range hood or
down draft exhaust shall not be less than 100 c¢fm at 0.10 in. w.g.

Table M1505.4.4(2)

Prescriptive Exhaust Duct Sizing

Minimum

Fan Tested cfm at Minimum Maximum Smooth Maximum Maximum
0.25 inches w.g. Flex Diameter Length in Feet Diameter Length in Feet Elbows?
50 4 inches 25 4 inches 70 3

50 5 inches 90 5 inches 100 3

50 6 inches No Limit 6 inches No Limit 3

80 4 inches® NA 4 inches 20 3

80 5 inches 15 5 inches 100 3

80 6 inches 90 6 inches No Limit 3

100 5 inchesP NA S inches 50 3

100 6 inches 45 6 inches No Limit 3

125 6 inches 15 6 inches No Limit 3

125 7 inches 70 7 inches No Limit 3

a. For each additional elbow, subtract 10 feet from length.

b. Flex ducts of this diameter are not permitted with fans of

this size.

0TS-1954.2




effective

filed 1/11/16,

WSR 16-03-025,

(Amending

AMENDATORY SECTION

7/1/16)

ien-)) Re-

((

WAC 51-51-1507

served.

Ircr o

R, I
A\

hoareo4 ENEW S 2N 13 macnh o
CxXTtaootT T WIto—T oo MmCeCCiaoTT=Cax

ool
= A g

+»a1
oL

o A
T

mcs

bat+h

£

+
| g g

CcO T

[ AT Ry sy wAwS 1 Yo

T T OTIT

IO C

)

1o+
T T

=

+ 1

n
TILT

o

o
OO T UTTIICTT

~

EN NS
W I CIrT It

TaL

Pl B Sk k|

n

T

alh 11

maor

+

CTITCT T
Tselhnee ot
1T

O

O

A
OTOTCT OO U100 e

T
ot <7

A8

e
12N
o

o

[ i Y @ ym mpm my

TO0ts
gz

r o

+ 1

3

hattat+t-~ A
oo T

arn A ol o1

11 g+
U I R Ry )

1 ey

11

Ty

T oo ©

CIT

OO

OOt T T Ty

[ S AW S i 3 & gy myn

oW

3

S+ 4
(./lk,k,_L\./,

o

n

harer 3
ST Ca TS

et Ao o~
TTOT

a1

mao

+

fFrrnm o+ o mea A 4+
- oo T OOt ottt

i 2

TITCO Ol

T OOTno [0 i 3 @ ym mpm my

+ 1

cCOTTTTT

T

[ g g

31 a3 e

L Aw = ap npw au 2y ¥ AT

Tnas

r Wl
T

+ 1
OTrt

QN

oot

[ S R w CIT

&

o PT O

T CtW T

nco

ot 2
[ A Ay e

w3+
W CTt

Ao~
o T T OoOTTOTTItrT

o

n
I

a4

A

Tl B L
oo Tt

=N
©

axzatoarmea ol 1

n

PENE RN i MNP
T T T OOCITTOUTT

Sz

o

o

A= 8

o —oTtia L
M1EQA7 2 22

Oy o C

PRS2

| +h
o e L

MI1ENT 2

T o e < e

T O 9

|SEE =R AT AT E

7

T OO

Nnorma 4+ A
t/\_,J_LI.l_L C T T

o

-
(@ e aw)

—~

0

3 an o

Camir

MI1ENQNT7 2 7
TTTOT

+~

o

MI1EQNT7 22 £
T O

M1EQNT7 22 B
T oY

N =£11) A= = = ¥ A

O

7

v e 7

ctzot e

PANE S BN I N2
vV oCIT O T T TTrNC 1T

Iz

Nt
OIrcc oo

oaont v

\A S s ey
aa1
[ e g np & gu m

3 n

oot
ITTO TN CTITUTT

TIhO

Oy o C

[ g g

— O

T

2N

IS TEE SN

+ 1

bz

T 1z S
(&>

S|

alh 11

\At/ul.l T e
oona

~Y

Ty

[ I Y & gm mpm

o
TTIoOTS

13

i

n o

N

TIroCcLCuoucCc TcITUOIro

1 o

1 ey

Orerat o

n o

N
TTIToCLCOCTCITUOITS .

T ot g~

Trc o

\

WIto—T
+ 1
(S m

— O

T CcTITy

~

o~ £ + 1
O

+-11
TIitocar T

3N o

ST R NN N S T
ot Ccopartc

dad

szt ~ame a1 7 1 <73
ESASIEN SA SRR gE S AS A

AR 1

n
CTOTT

T

~Y

TIT

(A

[ i 3 & ym mpm my

nt
3 g e

o
A3

=N
0

hotrodt oot oo oo

|
ToCTo T

hoa1iadt aszat Ao

-

=1
ToOTT T

T

Oy o CoIho [ i & ym mpm my

TITo oo T

TS e
ot o

Oy o C

TITOTho T

3z

D NI 3
1S3 S = =AY

+

T

+ 1
OTtt

ma - o

4

T T oy

3

N

ITOlirT T to cacoy

Aaha-m
A=

+ ok
oW L CCIIT Sy

IR R X

e~

A=

O

morrroac

~MY

i

o

13

nais

N

TIrc oo to

nt

aszot Ao

1o+ 4 ~n

N

rant
ITC T T TOOCITTUTT

o

TTIOTS

13

i

o

13

s

N

TIrcTIraotT™o

n

WITOT

TILO

Oy o C
i

\

WITO T

A

\1LA_:_J:/J:/ A=

P S B B X

EEW=I I TSN B 2N

3 g

ITrCc It

o~
<
+~h

oW LT CCTT

+

ot oama ol

szt ] a4 2~
ITTC T T O CITOUTT

o
TToT o

13

[STyaws )

o Ty

Tt C

i

[ ') & iy mpm uy

AR L

n
T

b

12N
o

alh 11

IR R L]

LLIE SN n
T

7\

Nt
AR I i e W g

o

rZOor

n

-
T

T+
W LT CTT

I3

[ i 3 @ ym mpm my ISATET I E ==L e yo

T

Tt N4

alh 11

T T

\

N

T+ zan+ 2
I \4 ITTC 11T T

ot
Ut/\./J_u L_,_I_J.J.v

TT

NN N
CapaoTT

K
A

[ i ¥ & ym mpm my

~

1

A\ i o iy e myw }

124

nit

Nt
A\ I i o i W

o

r o
T T

A\

-~

I anrn

EEeN |
PP T IarCct S

o1l g o
ooty

o

£y

ner

4

\,LL\JJ_\_.j_LZ_A_LL\_.j

n ror g

+ 1
W CIrrooc

1
o o e mp 7

A1

szt Am
= A=A T 11

-~

n
CTOTT

3

randa
—Cats

Nt
OIrc OO

o

+ 1

N

1ok o1 ~££
|6 N S E— -

o

3z

RN

T C

I
ona
T TTWO T T

[ 3 ) &y mg

TOoOoT T

| == 4

-

Wi

n o

N

CTOoOTIro 7/

ot a ey 0o o

P

1o+ 4

N

Naoant
J 8 W m iy @ ) W 7

o
ToOTOo

4

1

T CcTITy

v

LA\ ¥ g m

Nt

4+
[ S S W T

rm

Tt

aszot Arn oy

BTSN S NN
ITTC T 1T OO CITOUTT

o
IToTOoT

13

kol o I

rm o

Tt

T

T

TIrC

Sy o CcCTttS
+1h + 1

\
WL CIT

WITO T

TIrc T cCcTTIrc

1 ey

TOTTOW I I .

AT

TA73

mer ] xz
Ot Ty

axzatoamea ol 1] =

1o+

3

xrzoant
J 8 W m iy @ R W 7

o
ToTo

4

wh

CIT

P11 NS R i i i & e e

Oy o C

WITO T

o

= A
(S uavs

EoI NN I~ SNEANE Sl I
T TT C T T T T CTTTT k,_L_Y

LR AN

1oy

ot

NN N
Capao=T

12N
©

sz ah 11
[ 1 & o mgm

Th

1T

COTT

oprTtTo Tty

o

e L .

oot

+ 1

1oy

ot

N
o
+ 1

W CcIrrooc

NN N
Capaio=T

Nt o
COTTIco oo

hoxr o

alh 11

<z
Y
—

2

T oo C©

ToCcTITy =3

T

I v

[ i ¥ & ym mpm my

TIT

+ 1
OTtt

ney

4

pleJ_\j_LZ_Lll\j

13 n reoya

1T aszat oA oo caana~nT vz o rgo
Qut/t/_L_Y TS

o
T o CTTO o

£ oo

TIT IOy O

Oy o C

TCTInoy

cO

nex

B

W=
g Jjoo c oo aoCc T oOTTUTTy

EEEW-E S|

=N o A
©

S ot |
T [ S &> N W ) [SSJ N I & Ry S

2 1 o+
vCoITCO T T T T

Iz
1Ten 402 Q B
(S )

+

n

n

T e T .

+
IS LT

TU T e U e T e L o

-

T S
T T

T T

r
T Cr

P

=
(e zg

o
A

+h o+ o+
CITT T LT
LN |
J S N AN U & R S

+
T

m
CTITr

1

o1y~ A
A8
2

= 1
eSSt

nt
A\ I B o iy e

K
o
o

ah 11
[F 3 3o pu ngn m
+ 7

asxzot Arn
+ 1

T
Tt Sy o CCTtt
= P

baa

o T
EAN i IS
TCOTTy oS

\w ary

Y

O—OTT—Ctt
T ni

+

o1

1a+t1on asza+ Am
L_)_YL_)L,

4

xzoant
vCITC T T C Tt OTT

3~

troant oo

rrm g

4

TCr

i

[ 3§ & mp uy

T

A\ i 3 & i s g i Wy @ i

Tt

TIrcCTIirr c CcTIrc

T

T e T

+
F SR A v g mry

hoxr

13

iz

Iz

+
OO

13

n
OTT

Wl

c—OT

o™

Tho C

-

31~

BT S g S

= A
T

TN
AU N R U S N

I I

-
Tr

ot oam ool
U_Y o O COTTT

Th

T IT

A

(SR R SAwS 1 1& i g np

morroac

TrTr v

[ 3 ) &y mp uy

T e U e

+

m
C TIIr

+
OO

13

o 2/

-

FSEEWN S

r
g i v

T

—

T o o T

(RS

0TS-1954.2



P |

oot

I P

PP
T AU CTUIMTTA T 1O COUTT T IO 10

n

2

at
TITo T T T ULy

EEE AW

P
S S s i @ i

= 0

AN + 1
IxC

~

[ § & u ngm uy

| P i 3 A R W

| ¥ aws

P =2 B
ST Z TG~

n

_
AT
£

o

17

TTIOT S

akh 11

h

+ 1

PP IR, g
ey NP @) RN N U U R By & N U

WITO T

CIT
11
TaiotTT

1

LLAVVAZY

)
[Sav re)

Nt
AP 1 i W W g

o

3 sz

=N

1

WwIiIrto T

T

CIIToa C

I

oL L AT O

0T

ol L LT

Py

e U .

o

13

ik
oo ST

P
[Cssawa

n o

2

g omaa i
i S i WD ) WP S W B Py l.J.UJ.J.»._),

1o

N I IS -]

oP

PR B I R
LTTTOoO COL 1T L.J_ULJ.,

1o

r

£

WItToO T

T

TaoacTiTy

A

o Tor

4

+

QN

[ R,
[ S @) N WS S i

14+ n _ aszoat v

4

ni
ITCcCrrracITOIT

Iz

(%) SR ey g =y g Y

\

+ ]

WL CIT

R

e

o

o
o T T OoOTTOaoIrrctT

n
LTIt

1 o+ Ao+ ~pen g

ES SN

n

£y

o

17

EIE ]

ni
COTTCTITaoTts

o

AW B Wi W o i gu B S A A W B

Ao TTIoT OO CIIalL CTIITa C

TactT

MIENT 2 2 (71

TTITIJU

Mol

T e 9\ L/

7

TTOo T

mITTote

N

T CcuoIrc oot pTer

=

4

ST

[AVAAVA: 3y ann piy

= U

7

T

UL U

T Ssguarc rooT

TOoT

o

o

o

~zoant

o
TTIOoOTS

13

i

YOyl a AT

=<z
k.)k/J——Lf/L_,_LV

oot

P A T e B

ma o g g

TIT T T CITT Ot

o
=}

1ok

+ o1

Trc o

\

TICTo — O WITO T
ah

I

IS AT

COOo T LT oL

Yooyl

+ 1

m

4
WIT T CTTIT

7\ aszatAm o

I Oy~ oIt

£ oo

P IR
S TS

PR SN

n
C T OTT

EER SRS v g mp =y

Tt
£z

[ R =y = 4

TCTIITO »

TITOTho T

Oy o CoIho

o

EERAS v np mp w2 11wy 3 ey e

o113 1 oam

+~

+ 1

3

P

m
\TAwAws1sawAw §

=N
©

n ok 11

ot 2

nt o

m

It

— O

I

T

CTOTT [} &y g uy

=}

CTIT LT O

A

oo
wh

aszoat A

At ]l A+ 2 A
T T T TOOCITTOUTT

Iz

o
TToTo

13

-
™

paaary

Oy o C

\

WITO T

heoao oo+~
T CIcso

K
£
AT

20

=

LR AW

ot

TaL

T T OW

hosxz

a1
[ 2 NN Ny & N S

1 a+3 an

N

szoant
[ Q) U e iy & i W B W i

o
S AwAY yw)

4

wh

WwWorcTT

ToCcTITy

Tt

T v O

WITO T

T

£

r o
T

|V I N SN

MIENT 22 (11

T OU

Tl
TTHo T

n
i

fak =N

el

R i e

Tt C

= T OW

rIorraraoccaor =}

T e 9o\t /-

7

Lo S = = == m = v

TOO

£ rem

o
OO

ot~ A
—OoOtCTToT

£ oo

o
o T

13

1

Wh

AR TS

alh 11

T OTtt

—CTT O

o

A8

TTInO

T— =TT
oz

A

Wk ki
mco oot Tt

m

oo
ah 11

1 ey
A my

IS

et =Y
[SATETS

=
T

I v

[ ) & e mp uy

©~a r o~
¥ St

Nt
TIrc T T

+ 1
(S

=N
©

I mer o

ot

Moragf o od g

r R i

It

.

TITCTICTO

~ 4
=@

T T LTIy O [ i 4 & gm mm my

T o

riIgrroraoac cor

A

wTrc T T

T

A

0TS-1954.2



akh 11 m

At s D =S
VvVCoITCOC I T CTITUIT

X3

o

13

TTIOT O

zh

Th

[ 3 Y & e g uy e tTT

it

WITO T

T

Eaav)

TToTTT

£V
[ S

N 7o

L
(A SATT I == 23T

=

N

o 2N £
o oL Ittt rrCcC—arcCao OT
g sz Mo

RNV 2N
T CTT

QY11
[SA™ = 1o my o

Vil
T

PG TP
CTITATT
1t A

A\ AW I AW L WA

o

o
oo

n
TITT

124+ A
\VAv R AT s wAw =

=

AVVASY

MIEAQNT 2 2 /(71

TTIT OO

o110 e

=

-
Tr

afm
CTItt

(&g mn

LA RT3 > = e

v e 9\ L/

7

T T

O

o~
TS

r A7
Y

1ok £1

£

+ 1

T rTIirr-oll T TtO0TT \awy

CIT

nameoro e

oP

o =R
AR

o Al
oIS

rall 1K1
AN 5 i s i O s e & 1 e

oy

o<z

T oy

T v

nlacae.

o

"N talha ~h Aty
It

T.T

A

I

r

R |

+ 1

EC2C N BEE SNEVDE N

+ 1

Tttty
1N
T

&
A

POV IUT

CIT

WIT T CTT

W ItaOoOw
ik

wo T OTL

CIT

EE 3310 g mpy = mp o

CIT

o f
CT1tt

Xz 3

LN

2 ok

+ o
LT1TT 1T CTO0

2

C oMo TTItTa c Tt OIT

mln g o~

=1

Eaa vy

T T

WITLTCTTIT

O

Xy J s e C A\

131

1

o r
CoOITCcroTrTTacoTCy

akh 11 I2N

r mat g OAreon T oo
OoTIIcLt o ctCtrrar—-

o

Stz

iz
TCToveS

Nt g

F A

[ 3 Y & i g uy

PTITIIIIg S

A\

MY

ITCL Yy

S e
TOO e

o

T I3 o
TOTTOWIITy oLl

+ 1

£

ol
C TN

+

n

S o
[CAV AN & e

T

T Ot C

[ & g g

A=
o

C

TIoT

cyralh
o A CTT

oo

1]

P
UHLJ.CK.,

EEENEEN roant
vCTITT

N

AN

£

£y

o

fal|

OO

| iy g

oML ITaltcT

T Ot ol

—CTT

SN
[eswAw Y

Eaav)

CIIalt

TOoTT

EVSEE N
[ g g

\PAT B UAW AW A w g my

Xz

ek ]
A& i u

Iz

C

J e

CIT

C

T

Xz

SN
[es wAwaY

+

Py

oP

QN

+ 1

oo

M aan

T

o zod
oy o C

i s e C

[ & g g

T

C

C

ey

TTrITy

|y g

33

of D v

S]]

1

N

CTaoaw L opa Tt Oy

IYCCICy

A

3 an o
= )

P
LT O C T T ITUTT

+
A\ U i & o

n

I NP
T

I
OLILTOWTIT

oo

P |

o

r

Narnh o1 +
TSP c

A

T

CTIITa C

o

T C

TOIrT T oo

T OO0 O

oo
ITTITY .

oP

A
LT T TN

g Frm + 1
CIT

r

N

oL

O L LT OTIr

N B I
vVCoITCOC I T T CITOUTIT

11

IO ST

RIS

n o

o119 e
EERAS v gu mp mp w2 11 g & ey e

+ ] BV

£z

o C oLy

Er=

P

WItToO LT

[ S

T

cO

T

orat A

Tt

graccTo

TITC

ma

P,

T+~

4

ni
ITCcCrrracITOIT

xz

+

2

-
i S W S WP W W S & i s g

ro

T+t A £

Atk o
\W S AN wrwe)

m

T

asxzod
oy o C

+

2

-
i S W S WP W W S & e s g

ro

Oy o CTItO

\

gLra oo™

TITC

33

T

ro
i S W S WP v W S @ i g

naiim

r o~

_ .
[ N -

+ 1 oty
[ S NP W U R S A

4+

+ 1 Bhaita 1 A4 -~
cre— oo Oy

£

2

o CcoTTOT—OT

tad o

O CIT
hanAal

ISES T T =211
+ 1

T

O

CIT

Th 13

£V

3

=Y

S

NP IV

RSN “R SO A~ N IR~ |
(3 A= " T R WL CIrLTIr T
ot

OIS C T OTIT

v

=
T

m

asxzod
A

TIICc—OoOUTUcCT

b

A\ T [ e S 1TITOTTI O IO
P |

o cLrTTltt

—CTT

T

ity

o
T OoOCTT™

at v~

£V

_ s
[ e -

N S
[ S NP W U R S A

n

nr

IR P S

12~

o s i g

r
\W s WA w

ol L L

O C L CTItr

T

cO

ot T

C

[ g g

0TS-1954.2



ot n
oo T TITUIT

+

n annt v o o
COITTco O oo

mat 1~ xr At
A" L g i iy & iy e By

+ 1 a4

o ot a +
T

[ A S mp my A e

oo coimaac T

cO CIT

A8

T OTTIIT

I e

ot

14

2

Iz
T T T

ot
1=

AL

£1
1T OW

raocyllg

T

M1EQNT 2 9

T IO

coo Tty

[ i & iy e oT A T AR

C

T EEAAS v g p mp e w 5

T T e Z .

7

4

oCcacCcLtOITs

o

R W]
o Ol Ity

m

T.T

=
T L LOW

r

TTO0OCT—COT

T.T

N
W I CTT (=8

TATT

T

T LTOW

Mmooy g vy

1ot + ~
T T T OTTITOTIT

EIE AR ]
TIroograc

PSRN aho11 W '

o prTc

n

|\ g o sy W i

T

T

cOoO—

A&

[© 3} & i mys S )

PrrIa o

+ ]
TTIICTTwW I oT

n

Qe

=N
o

P |

+ o

T

Alota

TIT T CTTO

£V
[ g

[N 2 W i & R Sy [ N WA WY I A WA W § A
B Ot A —
O CTIT 1O MMM T T 1T T T 1T

-
A
+ ol

TIT LT CTTO

o

7

iz
T v S

Nt iz
STy

Br ot £~
proTcceceTttD
ah 11 ant A

|C R AW aw W

MY

T L OTLr

S e
TOO e

o

+ PR IR

+ 1

CIT

£

r
& g g

+

n

S o

1

b

TOTTOWIITYy oLl

T L OTIT

cO cTois

O o0 oo 1oT

T OoOTCTTT

fal|

[©F 3} & i mps S )

cyralh
o A CTT

oo

1]

et ]
UHLJ.CL,

i
VI C

X3

PN I BN

EEAY

£

r o

o

OO

| iy g

oML TTalrcT

T °TCT 1T aTT
1 + pat A
(&9 AW v, A\ AW I S W S W A W

Eaav)

CIIalt

TOoTT

r

_ .
€ N -

r

Xz

P

Iz

C

i s s e

CIT

\PAw i ey m

C

T

+ 1

2 £ R,
(@ WA v,

Py
o T

o

4

N
[Z == EaC

m 11 ] oo +h ren BN
o
PR

o zod
oy o C

[ g g i s e C

CIT

C

[ N S —

ey

OIrrToo

TIT

of D v
goaLray

oy g
CTaowx

ER=

N
X L_J.k/,

=7 A\

O oTECT

PSR WNE S RN
o tTCTTOTT

K
TIT 1O

m

=

(=T T 3r]

m

asxzod
Oy o C

n

1o+

4

rrem
ITC I T TOOCITOUIT

\

o

4

TTIOT S

h

=
(&3

m

T«

WITO T

[ S

TICTOo

I

m

£ axzot

o
i S W S 7 Wl W S @ e s g

+ 1

CIT

RN +h v~

N N SN SN N |
oo TrTcaioTt

T

=

£V

e A
A\ AW I S W | WA W

Oy o oIt

CITOOygylT

oo CT

[ g g

C

PR |

2

T rrcacoTT

h ol

£V
T T O

ant A
—OoOCaotTctCt

P
TITO oS T

e A
A\ AW I AW LW AW

oo T v T

+ 1
TIrcarxc

E ey

T
+ 1

T LT T CCT

0T

[ g

+ 1

WL CIT

LR

n
e s

N7z o

a
oV T CC7y

EEESY

maxz
Ty

£V
T

14
[ S N S wy

o

QN

I

| i

[Cnw

0T

T

SOttt S
+ 1

+ ]

P R I S N N | EENEEEL0N
S N S v s e §

=

4

ot
C oI T T OIT

o

o

o

£on

A\ T

P oITal

| ¥ a s

cO

Tty O I | i oo tT A\ (&3

CIT

2%

[@s13ary

r

.
[ N .

PO

catman ] <7
STPOPTY

r
T

nr

o

C LT

=}

COo LIt

o

CIT

LT CIT

O CcO

T

T OTTIIT

a1 (7
STUPPTY

n

4

ot
oI C T OUIT

o

PR

1t A
A\ A B WA W B WL

i s i e C \wavawnw

[ g g

T

X

m
O C L CTItt

PR K
[ S PR W U R S A § [ e S

v

ot 2~
C OIS T T ITOIT O

o

o

PP
A\ S W B u wn

P
J

K]
| S S

ot~

LT OTTOTTTH

A
A\ AW I AW L WA

WA
XL

m

P,

r

=

o
[ S W B W7 Wl W S @ s s

S

it

o

=
T T o T

o+
a T
14+

=N

ah 11

Oy o C oIt

| ¥ e

\
ah

o c L TTltt

—CtTT

T

oT

[SF 3 5 & pu ngu m
1

ot

nr

o

Neas +h r 7 £ A~
) A oy e o A

£V

o £
[ S N E U W

4

oI T Co

r
T

T.T

oltar L otT CoOrmrrc o TtctO Ot TT

oo CT
+ 1

Y
PV CITC

o

OTOW

1z

1

alh A~

I

~reant

LN

NS

g o :

n

2

TITTOCT

| ¥ a s

cO

O IIoOTIS

P i B g £ @ i iy

oo TIIcT

ToLrractT

(&3

TITCO

Y

terealss oto
Ty

P
u_)k/J.J.b/L_J.V

QN

BN

ah o1 1] =N

PR

e A
A\ AW I AW L WA

alh o~

I

oL ZCTTh

C O T [ § & u ngm uy 0T MT

i s s e

[ g g

T

r

e A
A\ AW I AW S WA W

oottt

i s s e

& e g

"

0TS-1954.2

12



"

clem Ao £+

oTATT

T+
W LTIt

a 173
N=A™ ==y =g SAAw

PRI

b

PP P, |

oy ot

[ani

\& Sy &y oy

=8

[SF § Y e i mpu m A

T

o+

P IS s

i mp ny W Iy W §

sz

MIEQNT 2 2 /(71

T OO

T

E o Qi
LT CT O

TaT

A F£1
mCo oo Tt

e R

m

My CT o T

v e 9\ L/

7

T T

[l A S S S mp ) S 4

T T OW

CIT

173

ot 9 o

bz =

MIENT 2 2 /71
J R G N v
o ot

Mol
i N & I W .

QA

o

£V

T.7

£

cCo o Tty W CIT

i mp e Iy W §

MY

T T e 9\ L/

7

[ A=) i m e mp e o 8 1T

LITACTT O

L 1T OW
£

n

4

S Cac IOty

EWeE L W]
o UL Tty

m

TTT

T.7

£

=

(=8
PN

1
IR AW AWAW § A

T.7

A

T T OW

T T OW

QA

Aoxza ~ o
v C<T

1 e

el o+
Lc\j O Tr k__LJ.J.\j

£V

TaT

1

£

3~

o

n
IXIT

[ A= S e mp mp e 8

T

Ry

O L Z

T TOW
MIENT 2 2 (71

TIT O
£ N 20 +

AU CUIMMMaAa T 10

AT Xz
TV

T T OW

P S

Ul o TalTT

o

a
PTrovIOcS

L]

LN

1 ok

zh

n T
It

o

£V

T.7

£

T O eI\ L/ WITTCTT
[ANATA 1SN
\ Tt CTT

LT LT T

LITATCTT O

T T OW

o1

r
T

IS XN

[=]

EEEA

o
oy

Qe

nxr

gy

W C

Ay e UU

U e Z U

oL

Mmoo g vy

1ot + ~
[ S N YWD ) U R iy @ Ny WS vy (&Y T T T TTITOTIT

EIE AR ]

ah 11 1 )

QI
A Sl A

g

T

A L

olra T O

O CITTOTT

E SWANE S S =
O T w I oStT

eV

n

o

=N
O

ah 11

+ o

T

[N S WL Wy i A waw § |-

[SF ¥y pu npu n

TIT T O CO

KR, I

TIT LT O CTO

1
L L

Qe A

R
MMM C T LT T T T

O IT T

Stz

ntErsz sy

CITTly

ot £~

=

nxr

|\ S AW S WA -

MY

T 1 OTIT

A

IS A

S e
(& re

o

T I3 o

ot o S + + 1 N v Ly £
TToCToT CIT
fal|

b

akh 11

O TOWITIg ol

L L T 1 OTIT

=y C TN

ITOoT

A [SAw) TS

[SF ¥ Y& pu npn sppuy w)

cyialh
o AT

130~ 7 oo

EEE =
oottty

i
VCITC

X3

PN B NN

SN

m

£

r 1o

o

[l

| g gy

T TCT T U ol appo I TdgliicT
ENEN

CIIaolr

L OUOoST LT

r

_ .
[ N .

r

A\ A I LW W A W g

Xz

1] A4

A\ i G

Iz

C

J

T

<

(&S W AW v

<

TTC

2 £ PR, I
[~

P
(& Sre ay e

o

N
[Z == EaC

+ 1 Tren BN
i
=T

CIT

oo

m 12

aszot
oy ot

[ e g J i e C

CIT

O ATV

=

|Z ¥ ¥ wreyw)

TIT

of D v
JaLdy

r
A

o

PR |
CTow=x

31

N

[=]

SPatt Sy

T rCy

N S n aszat A
Sy o C

4

iz xroant
ITCrIrracTOoOrr

o

r
T

133

T ot~

4

rror
ITC I CIUIT

\Y

o

N

ITOTNS

wh

paaary

\Y

Y

OV

a T

T

oIty o

WITO T

1z n = 4
WOTIS 1T LT

T.T

AR

1

]

T

A\ R & ) wy o)

g Y e

mes

crzeat

T abd A

4

roaoaosrzaprsy irent
vCcITCrracToUlT

MIENT 2 2 (71

TTITIU

T

FoE=N

Oy o LTINS

LT Ceuve Ly

T O eI\t /= T

7

LT LT

I

[ Al S S e ey e - 8

£
A

(MDY
(I ISv )

v L™

R

2
L L TIT T T CTO

Ot A
|\ R AW WA W

hey o+ g 1
|\ S5 5 1 o S § £ & B ) s sy & i

7

Ntz vy
CIrcry Y
ant A
T—OoCToT

fal|

at oA £y
CTCO 0T

nxr
IS A

—~
TS e

=

o

T I3 o

£

+ 1

£~
CIT

T 1 OTIT

r

+ =1 —

n

= o

o

b

P S |

TOTTOWITIg ol

L L

O CTIx

ITOoOT

A o TS

olra L T

cyralh
o A CTT

o

—~
[l

P

IEE |
oottty

ENEEC N I BN roant
[ Sl = S Sy 3 e VCITC

SN

£

v o

o

|y gu

T rrToCTC T OTnr altl
SN

CIIaolr

L OUOST LT

EVS N
[&

\CAV I LW S W AW g =

Xz

ek ]
A & iy e

Iz

|

i s e

CIT

ATV

|

TTC

0TS-1954.2

13



4

r

4

[ g s

e 4
CIT

2 £ SN

Py
o T

o

4

IS norn o~
A SATE T E 23T 0
QN

+1 <z

T, I
[SNw)
D o~

TIT

o zod
Oy o C

C

i s e

o OV

C

T

T C

| iy g

S]]

gaoaLray

=7 O

O oTECT

TTOWwWT

IYCCICy

S A

-

o
TOCToxT

o o Nratza Ao~
PTrovoTig

el 124
g

oo T
N 28

A4

IO

ITaooo C

hoasz

N

~ 4
T

afm

o +hoan BN
o7

o
oo

n

ot 0o

T.T

Fom £

Mmoo 3 vt

T C I T CITCCItt

=
(&3

akh 11

T

=4
= o A
[CEsaw

£

|\ O

CTIITlL

TTIOoOT

TaoacTiTy

ol L LTOW
hat+h

T v O
LR N

WwWTr T

[ ¥ 4 & nu s m
ah

on

r mao
EEAwAWS 11 Te)

a2 o

b NP PSR
[ SNy @7 N U i N SN I S

mao

v
O

Oor 11y

+

o

[N =y 1 § i e g @ s

7 A

=}

OO CIIT T OOTto gy

gTooagtT

T o

3

£

r o

|V P N SN

o LR ENE SN oE 1oy

1ok

28

o

T T OW

Tt

[ S KT CCIICIToS -

TITCITIC O ooy

[Cnw

rIorragraogccor T o

W C T T

T TTItT

o

selh N 1a o axzot Ao akh 11 K

ol
—TOCT T

Lo [ ') & g uy o COTT

Oy o C

A3

T o T

)

)

a1
[SACAA G e up & u

=

PN N T
oty

ah 11 W
[OF 5 & pu nps py WA o

o

acaont
A e e ey

axzot A
Oy o C oIt

a ] szl 10t
CxXTIToo ST

TooTT T

n o

mao
Mmoo .

NEW SECTION

kler sys-

t fire-sprin

ing uni

2904—Dwell

Section

WAC 51-51-2904

tems.

talled

ins

Sprinklers shall be

P2904.1.1 Required sprinkler locations.
to protect all areas of a dwelling unit.

EXCEPTIONS:

1. Uninhabitable attics, crawl spaces and normally unoccupied concealed spaces that do not contain fuel-fired appliances do not require

sprinklers. In uninhabitable attics, crawl spaces and normally unoccupied concealed spaces that contain fuel-fired equipment, a sprinkler

shall be installed above the equipment; however, sprinklers shall not be required in the remainder of the space.

2. Clothes closets, linen closets and pantries not exceeding 24 square feet (2.2 m2) in area, with the smallest dimension not greater than

3 feet (915 mm) and having wall and ceiling surfaces of gypsum board.

0TS-1954.2

14



	WSR 20-02-057.pdf
	OTS-1954.2

