
2024 International Building Code Significant Changes Report

2024 Code Section Title or Subject Reviewer Comments Cost
Yes/No

Amend Needed
Yes/No

TAG Comments/Recommendations

202 Occupiable Roof No amendment needed No No Coordinate with IFC TAG

403.3.1 Number of Sprinkler Risers and 
System Design

No: See ICC G56-21 No ICC Proposed Changes

403.3.1.1 Buildings 420 feet or less in 
height

No: See ICC G56-21 No ICC Proposed Changes

403.3.1.2 Buildings more than 420 feet in 
height

No: See ICC G57-21 No ICC Proposed Changes

403.5.3 Stairway Door Operation This proposal may increase the cost of 
construction. Emergency or standby power 
systems may need to be connected to the 
stairway door locking systems permitted in these 
code section to help ensure the door locks 
remain locked where that’s important to the 
functioning of the building

Increase: See ICC G60-21 No ICC Proposed Changes

01 Scope and Administration

No Significant Changes
02 Definitions

03 Occupancy Classification

No Significant Changes
04 Special Detailed Requirements Based on Occupancy and Use

2024 International Building Code Significant Changes Report

Page 1 of 52

https://www.iccsafe.org/wp-content/uploads/IBC-General-compressed-2021-Group-A.pdf
https://www.iccsafe.org/wp-content/uploads/IBC-General-compressed-2021-Group-A.pdf
https://www.iccsafe.org/wp-content/uploads/IBC-General-compressed-2021-Group-A.pdf
https://www.iccsafe.org/wp-content/uploads/IBC-General-compressed-2021-Group-A.pdf


2024 International Building Code Significant Changes Report

407.4.4.4 Circulation Paths Within a Care 
Suite

No: See ICC G71-21 No ICC Proposed Changes

411.3.1 Alarm Presignal Decrease: See ICC G86-21 
PtII

No ICC Proposed Changes

411.3.2 Alarm Activation Decrease: See ICC G86-21 
PtII

No ICC Proposed Changes

411.6 Flammable Decorative 
Materials

Decrease: See ICC G86-21 
PtI

No ICC Proposed Changes

414.2.5.4 Flammable Gas Decrease No

T414.2.5.4 Maximum Allowable Quantity 
of Low Burning Velocity 
Category 1B Flammable Gas in 
Group M and S Occupancies 
Per Control Area

Decrease No

Page 2 of 52

https://www.iccsafe.org/wp-content/uploads/IBC-General-compressed-2021-Group-A.pdf
https://www.iccsafe.org/wp-content/uploads/IBC-General-compressed-2021-Group-A.pdf
https://www.iccsafe.org/wp-content/uploads/IBC-General-compressed-2021-Group-A.pdf
https://www.iccsafe.org/wp-content/uploads/IBC-General-compressed-2021-Group-A.pdf


2024 International Building Code Significant Changes Report

415.11.1.1 Hazardous Materials None: See ICC G91-21 No ICC Proposed Changes

423.4.1 Design Occupant Capacity No No

423.4.2 Location This will increase the cost of construction on 
some projects (where a campus has multiple 
buildings far apart) by requiring critical 
emergency
operations centers have the same travel distance 
requirement that E occupancy areas do. In cases, 
this will require multiple storm shelters as it
does for E occupancy facilities.

Increase: See ICC G95-21 No ICC Proposed Changes

Table 509.1 Incidental Uses Language added to I occs and Ambulatory Care 
Facilities "and automatic Sprinkler System"

y N Needs additional Review this is not a significant Change 

 

05 General Building Heights and Areas

Page 3 of 52

https://www.iccsafe.org/wp-content/uploads/IBC-General-compressed-2021-Group-A.pdf
https://www.iccsafe.org/wp-content/uploads/IBC-General-compressed-2021-Group-A.pdf


2024 International Building Code Significant Changes Report

704.2 Protection of Primary 
Structural Frame

This is a significant editorial change to combine 
multiple requirements from earlier versions. 

No No

06 Types of Construction

No Significant Changes
07 Fire and Smoke Protection Features

Page 4 of 52



2024 International Building Code Significant Changes Report

705.7.1 Floor assemblies in Type III 
construction

This is clarification to address platform 
construction for supporting construction of 
loadbearing exterior walls in Type III 
construction. The new model code change has 
been historically used as a method to address 
this condition based on the American Wood 
Council handbook.

No No

706.1.2 Deemed to comply of party 
walls

The use of NFPA 221 has been allowed in Section 
706.2, and this allows the use of double fire 
walls. NFPA 221 provides additional 
requirements beyond structural stability that ICC 
deemed to provide the same level of 
performance as those requried in this section. 

No No

710.4 Exception Continuity This Exception is intended to address challenging 
issues with providing multiple access for 
ductwork above ceilings. Refer to FS49-21

No No

08 Interior Finishes

Page 5 of 52



2024 International Building Code Significant Changes Report

803.13 Interior Finish Requirements 
based on occupancy

Adopt Model Code Language No No

903.2.2.2 Laboratories involving testing, 
research and development

Automatic sprinklers are required in lab for 
reasearch or testing of lithium-ion or lithium 
metal batteries. Considering the hazard 
associated with these batteries, it makes sense 
that ICC approved this new amendment. The 
benefit would outweigh the increase in cost. (F66-
21: Approved As Submitted)

Yes No

903.2.4 Group F-1 This is similar to 903.2.2.2 except that this is for a 
manufacturing facility involving lithium-ion or 
lithium metal batteries. (Part of F66-21: 
Approved As Submitted)

Yes No

903.2.7.3 Lithium-ion or lithium metal 
battery storage

Similar to 903.2.2.2 and 903.2.4 Yes No

903.2.9 Group S-1 Similar to 903.2.2.2 and 903.2.4 Yes No

09 Fire Protection and Life Safety Systems

Page 6 of 52



2024 International Building Code Significant Changes Report

903.4.3 Alarms Visual alarm device is now required in addition to 
an audible device to be located outside of a 
building protected by an automatic sprinkler 
system.

Yes (should be minimal) No

907.2.1 Group A Code change brings into the IBC a few exceptions 
for fire alarm systems and emergency voice 
alarm communication
systems.  These exceptions are buried in a 
standard that is not referenced from Chapter 9 of 
the IBC or the IFC.  As a result, designers and 
codeofficials may not be aware that the 
exception already exists.
Per ICC, code change  will decrease the cost of 
construction.
(ICC CAH F86-21: Approved As Submitted)

No No

Page 7 of 52



2024 International Building Code Significant Changes Report

907.2.2.2 Laboratories involving research 
and development or testing.

Per ICC, The code change  will increase the cost 
of construction.
On a straight forward analysis this series of 
changes increases the cost construction. 
However, the majority of the medium to large 
size facilitiesinvolved in these activities do have 
detection and any new construction of this 
nature includes detection. Balanced against the 
cost of a fire that cannot be extinguished 
routinely the installation of the early detection is 
ultimately a savings.
(ICC CAH F88-21: Approved As Submitted)

Yes No

907.2.4.1 Manufacturing involving 
lithium-ion or lithium metal 
batteries.

New in 2024: See above for note on cost impact
(ICC CAH F88-21: Approved As Submitted)

Yes No

907.2.7 Group M 907.2.7.2 is a coordinating pointer where an M 
Group occupancy would require detection. based 
upon proposed Section 321.
No cost impact.
(ICC CAH F88-21: Approved As Submitted)

No No

907.2.7.2 Storage of lithium-ion or 
lithium metal batteries.

New in 2024, No cost impact (ICC CAH F88-21: 
Approved As Submitted)

Yes No

907.2.10.2 Storage of lithium-ion or 
lithium metal batteries.

New in 2024 (ICC CAH F88-21: Approved As 
Submitted)

Yes No

Page 8 of 52



2024 International Building Code Significant Changes Report

909.20.5.4 Smoke detection This requirement is from NFPA 92, which has 
historically been provided, similar to the same 
requirement under the elevator pressurization 
section. (FS115-21: Approved as Submitted)

No No

909.21 Elevator hoistway 
pressurization alternative

Multiple published papers identify how elevator 
hoistway pressurization systems will impact 
other smoke controls systems serving high-rise 
buildings, including stair pressurization. While 
Section 909.4.7 specifically requires the engineer 
to consider the interaction of multiple systems, 
the need should be emphasized when the 
building is the building utilizes elevator 
pressurization to protect the hoistway. As the 
components/systems utilized to mitigate the 
impact are critical to the functionality of the 
system, the language simply clarifies the entire 
system must comply with the provisions of 
Section 909. (FS116-21: Approved as Submitted)

No No

912.5 (912.5.1 - 
912.5.4)

Signs Currently both the IBC section 905.2 and IFC 
section 905.2 require the signage for fire 
department connection to meet the
requirements found in NFPA 14 Standard for the 
Installation of Standpipes and Hose Systems. This 
code change pulls those requirements into the 
IFC for quick identification. 
Cost Impact: Per ICC, The code change  will not 
increase or decrease the cost of construction. 
This is already a requirement and is an editorial 
clarification.
(ICC CAH F99-21: Approved As Submitted)

No No

Page 9 of 52



2024 International Building Code Significant Changes Report

915.1 General New exception in 2024 No No

915.1.1 Where required New language in 2024 affects existing state 
amendment. Recommend adopting model code 
changes and adding R-2 at Item 5 to match 
existing state amendment.

No Yes

915.2.4 CO-producing forced-air 
furnace.

New in 2024 Yes No

915.2.5 Private garages. New in 2024 Yes No

Page 10 of 52



2024 International Building Code Significant Changes Report

915.2.6 All other occupancies. New in 2024 Yes No

915.3.1 Alarm limitations. New in 2024. No No

915.3.2 Fire alarm system required. New in 2024 Yes No

915.3.3 Fire alarm systems not 
required.

New in 2024 No No

915.3.4 Installation. New in 2024 instructions. No No

915.4.4 Interconnection. New in 2024 No No

915.5.4 Occupant notification New in 2024 Yes No

Page 11 of 52



2024 International Building Code Significant Changes Report

915.5.5 Duct Detection Restricts the use of a technology not covered by 
referenced standards such as UL 2075/UL 2034. 
Per ICC, code change will not increase/decrease 
the cost of construction. (ICC CAH F104-21)

No No

917.2 Group E occupancies. New in 2024: (ICC CAH F105-21) Yes No

1107.2 exception #1 Electrical vehicle charging stations Exception #1 Electrical vehicle charging stations 
provided to serve Group R-3 and R-4 occupancies are 
not required to comply with this section. Consider 
redacting R-4.       Exception #2 allows excluding 
Electric vehicle charging stations used exclusively by 
buses, trucks, other delivery vehicles, law enforcement 
vehicles and motor pools are not required to comply 
with this section. Consider including in WA law 
enforcement.  Consider redacting all other vehicle 
mentions in #2

No Yes Modify Existing

1201.1 Scope Expanded scope Yes No Adopt change

10 Means of Egress

No Significant Changes
11 Accessibility

12 Interior Environment

Page 12 of 52



2024 International Building Code Significant Changes Report

1202.3 Unvented attic and unvented 
enclosed rafter assemblies

R Value percentages No No Adopt change

Page 13 of 52



2024 International Building Code Significant Changes Report

1202.4.3.2 Conditioned Spaces Change reference from International Energy 
Conservation Code to Washington State Energy 
Code

No Yes

1206 SOUND TRANSMISSION Engineering analysis shall be performed by a 
registered design professional.

Yes No Adopt change

1208 INTERIOR SPACE DIMENSIONS change matches WA amendment No NO Adopt change

Page 14 of 52



2024 International Building Code Significant Changes Report

1210.2 Finish Materials Clarification, expanded scope, renumbering Yes No Adopt change

Page 15 of 52



2024 International Building Code Significant Changes Report

1211 UV GERMICIDAL IRRADIATION 
SYSTEMS

UL 8802 Requirement Yes No Adopt change

1602.1 Notations If there is no Washington Note An amendment is 
needed to add one.

No No An amendment may be needed if there is no WA Note 
Is in the ASCE 7-16 but not the ASCE 7-22

No Significant Changes
16 Structural Design

No Significant Changes

14 Performance Requirements

No Significant Changes
15 Roof Assemblies and Rooftop Structures

13 Energy Efficiency

Page 16 of 52



2024 International Building Code Significant Changes Report

1603.1.3 Roof snow load data Requirments to provide detailed snow load data 
was relaxed from areas where ground snow load 
is 15 psf, rather than 10 psf.  Some additional 
indformation like Risk Category are required to 
be reported.

No No

1603.1 & others Construction 
Documents:General

Code now defines both ground snow load and 
allowble stress design ground snow load.  Various 
changes throughout code to incorproate this 
change.

No No

Page 17 of 52



2024 International Building Code Significant Changes Report

1603.1.9 Roof rain load data additional information on roof drains and 
scupper infomration is required on drawings

No No

1604.4 Analysis Clarification of flexible versus rigid diaphragms No No

1604.5 exception 2 Risk Category Most free standing parking garages shall be Risk 
Category 2

No No

Page 18 of 52



2024 International Building Code Significant Changes Report

Group I-3 occupancies, except for condition 1 
was changed from Risk Category 3 to Risk 
Category 4

Yes No

Power-generating stations that are required to 
be Risk Category 3 were specified as > 75 MW

No No

General statement defining Risk Category 4 
expanded to include, "and buildings where loss 
of function represents a substantial hazard to 
occupants or users,"

Yes No

Risk Category 4 now includes "Public utility 
facilities providing power generation, potable 
water treatment, or wastewater treatment."

Yes No

Table 1604.5 Risk Category

Page 19 of 52



2024 International Building Code Significant Changes Report

1604.5.1 Multiple occupancies Clarification on when "systems" for multiple 
occupancies are required to be assigned to 
higher risk cetegory.

No No

1604.5.2 Photovoltaic (PV) panel 
systems

section added NO No

Table 1607.1 & 
1607.6.1

Helipads Seciton was reworded but overaal loading 
remains essentially the same. 

No No

Page 20 of 52



2024 International Building Code Significant Changes Report

Page 21 of 52



2024 International Building Code Significant Changes Report

Page 22 of 52



2024 International Building Code Significant Changes Report

1607.3 Uniform live loads Clrificaiton on partially loading of floors and 
roofs.

No No

Page 23 of 52



2024 International Building Code Significant Changes Report

1607.5 Partition Loading Clairfy that LL reduciton is not allowed for 
partition loads, unless live load is > 80 psf

No No

1607.8.2 Fire truck and emergency 
vehicles

editorial changes and clarifying that emergency 
vehicle loads are not combined with other live 
loads

No No

1607.13.2 Alternative uniform live load 
reduction

Live Load reduction was re-arranged, but overall 
loading is the same

No No

Page 24 of 52



2024 International Building Code Significant Changes Report

1608 Snow Loads Clarification on snow loads being "strength 
based" or "allowable stress"

Maybe Yes Proposal Needed. Snow load tables in ASCE have 
changes.  Are WA maps are more appropriate, and are 
more sensitive to elevation changes.

1609.5 & others Tornado Loads Tornado loading was added and involves many 
secitons, but per Figure 1609.5, all of the State of 
Washington is "outside the  tornado-prone 
region" so these changes do not impact the State 
building code.

No No

Page 25 of 52



2024 International Building Code Significant Changes Report

1611 Rain loads The Design Rain Loads section (1611.1) added 
the dp term to the load equation which is for the 
additional depth of water due to deflection of 
the roof under water and dead load deflection

No No

Page 26 of 52



2024 International Building Code Significant Changes Report

T 1611.1 Rain loads Table 1611.1 was also added for design storm 
return periods by Risk Category; in 2021 this was 
all based on a 100-year return period. 

No No

1613.2 Determination of seismic 
design category

Language changed to incorporate language from 
ASCE 7-22, including adding Site Class DE.

No No

1613.4 Amendments to ASCE 7 insert WAC language, ASCE 7-22 incorporates 
most if not all of WAC amendments. We may get 
rid of WAC Amendment?  More study needed.

No No

1615 Tsunami Loads Delete model code section and include WAC No No

Page 27 of 52



2024 International Building Code Significant Changes Report

Page 28 of 52



2024 International Building Code Significant Changes Report

Page 29 of 52



2024 International Building Code Significant Changes Report

1705.2.2 Structural stainless steel Inspection requirements for stainless steel 
added.

No No

1705.2.6 Metal building systems Inspection requirements for metzl building 
systems added.

Yes No

1803.5.1 Investigated conditions - 
Classification

Added the language "Rock shall be classified in 
accordance with ASTM D5878."  

No No

18 Soils and Foundations

17 Special Inspections and Tests

Page 30 of 52



2024 International Building Code Significant Changes Report

1803.5.2 Questionable Soil and Rock Added "moisture sensitivity" to list of 
questionable soil properties that permits a 

        

Yes No

1803.5.3 Epansive Soils Replaced references to ASTM D422 with ASTM 
D6913.  No direct cost increase due to IBC 
changes, however const increases may result 

  

Reference Standard 
Dependent

No

1803.5.4 Groundwater Changed language from "subsurface soil 
investigation" to a "geotechnial investigation" 
and removed the exception for waterproofing 
eliminating the need to soil investigation.

Yes No

1803.5.6 Rock strata Changed language from requiring "multiple 
borings" to "asses variations in rock strata 
depth".  The new language appears to be a 
clairification of the original intent, as opposed to 

No No

1807.2.5 Guards Added provisions for guards at retaining walls. Yes No

1807.3 Embedded posts and poles Added option to follow ASABE EP 486.3 in place 
of IBC 1807.3.1 through 1807.3.3

No No

Page 31 of 52



2024 International Building Code Significant Changes Report

1808.8.6 Sesimic Requirements Seismic Design Cateogeory C is now required to 
follow the provisions of ACI 318 section 18.3

Yes No

1809.14 Grade Beams States grade beams shall comply with the 
provisions of ACI 318, with an exception for 
grade beams with limited diffrential settlement 
and is design to resist seismic load effects 
including overstrength.  Grade beams perviously 
were designed following the provisions of ACI 
318, therefore the only added language beyond 
clairification is an exception, therefore not cost 
increase.

No No

1810.2.2 Stability Replaced the language "Does not exceed 12 
times the least horizontal dimension" with 
"analysis demonstrates that the element can 
support the required loads, including misloca- 
tions required by Section 1810.3.1.3, with neither 
harmful distortion nor instability in the 
structure."  In some situations the new provisions 
may require higher capacity deep foundations, 
therefore there is a potential cost increase.

Potential No

Page 32 of 52



2024 International Building Code Significant Changes Report

1810.3.3.2 Allowable Lateral Load Added clarifying language, including the 
requirement of group effects per section 
1810.2.5.  This is not a new requirement, but a 
reiteration in this section for clairty, section 
1810.2.5 previously specified it was required for 
lateral loads.  No cost increase.

No No

1810.3.8 Precast Concrerte Panels Site class designations are updated to be 
consistent with ASCE 7-16

No No

1810.3.9.4.2.1 Site Classes A through DE Site class designations are updated to be 
consistent with ASCE 7-16

No No

Page 33 of 52



2024 International Building Code Significant Changes Report

18120.3.12 Grade Beams Added additional differential settlment 
requirements in order to use the exception for 
section 18.13.3.1.    In some situations the new 
provisions may require higher capacity deep 
f d i  h f  h  i   i l  

Potential No

1810.4.5 Vibratory Driving Added guidance for installation of production 
elements.  No direct cost increase.

No No

1901.2.1 Structural concrete with GFRP 
reinforcement

Section added No No

2203.1 Structural Stainless Steel - 
General

Added reference to AISC 370 for Structural 
Stainless Steel Design.  The code reference 
includes guidance for systems not previously in 
the IBC  therefore no cost increase  

No No

2204.1 Cold Formed Steel - General Added reference to AISI S310 for the design of 
cold formed steel diaphragms.  The code 
reference includes guidance for systems not 
previously in the IBC, therefore no cost increase. 

No No

20 Aluminum

No Significant Changes

19 Soils and Foundations

21 Masonry

No Significant Changes
22 Steel

Page 34 of 52



2024 International Building Code Significant Changes Report

2205.1 Cold Formed Stainless Steel - 
General

Added reference to ASCE 8 for Cold Formed 
Stianless Stainless Steel Structural Design.  The 
code reference includes guidance for systems not 
previously in the IBC, therefore no cost increase. 

No No

2206.3 Cold Fomred Steel Cutting and 
Notching

Added references for cutting and notching for 
structural members (AISI S240) and non-
structural memebers (AISI S220).  No significant 
cost increase. 

No No

2210 Metal Building Systems Added specific references for Metal Building 
Systems.  While there is new guidance, the new 
code provisions are a clairification as the 
references point to typical structural steel design 
provision which Metal Buildings are already 
designed for.  Therefore no cost increase

No No

2211 Industrial Boltless Steel 
Shelving

Added reference to MHI ANSI/MH 28.3 and 
Chapter 15 of ASCE 7 for the design of Industrial 
Botless Steel Shelving.  The code reference 
includes guidance for systems not previously in 
the IBC, therefore no cost increase. 

No No

Page 35 of 52



2024 International Building Code Significant Changes Report

2212 Industrial Steel Work Platforms Added reference to MHI ANSI/MH 28.3 and 
Chapter 15 of ASCE 7 for the design of Industrial 
Botless Steel Shelving.  The code reference 
includes guidance for systems not previously in 
the IBC, therefore no cost increase. 

No No

2305.1.2 Permanent load duration Change correlates the NDS to the IBC No No

2404.1 Wind Loads This section has a re-written format but contains 
all of the elements of the 2021 WA State 
Amendments shown 

no no

2406.4.3 Glazing in Windows  Changes in #1/2 text adds the clause “or 
adjacent to walking surfaces” adds clarity and 
should be retained.
 Text of Exception #3 changed from “25 feet” in 
2021 Code to “8 feet” in 2024 Code.

no no

23 Wood

24 Glass and Glazing

Page 36 of 52



2024 International Building Code Significant Changes Report

2407.1.1 Loads Safety factor of 4 for glass handrails and guards 
has been omitted from Section 2407.1.1 and 
replaced with new language

no no

Section 2703 Lightning Protection Systems

Recommendation: possible significant change accepted; 
seems logical to limit where lightning protection systems can 
be installed and how to interconnect those systems. This may 
increase costs; however, that would be negligible and never 
“requires” the systems to be installed it just outlines when you 
shouldn’t and if you choose to what all should be connected to 
it. NFPA was the proponent and provided lots of justification; 
note, original proposal was to require on all buildings. What 
was approved was "when installed". 

Yes Yes Coordinate with LNI Electrical Division

No Significant Changes
26 Plastic

No Significant Changes
27 Electrical

25 Gypsum Panel Products and Plaster

Page 37 of 52



2024 International Building Code Significant Changes Report

TABLE 2902.1

MINIMUM NUMBER OF 
REQUIRED PLUMBING 
FIXTURES

Many revisions added to Table 2902.1 providing 
numerous additional subdivisions of occupancy 
which require a detailed review for cost 
implications. These additional categorizations 
seem to offer advantages and clarity at common 
mixed occupancy conditions. Merger with WA 
version of table will be required with WA 
addition of the Occupancy Column. No Yes

28 Mechanical Systems

No Significant Changes
29 Plumbing Systems

Page 38 of 52



2024 International Building Code Significant Changes Report

Page 39 of 52



2024 International Building Code Significant Changes Report

Page 40 of 52



2024 International Building Code Significant Changes Report

Page 41 of 52



2024 International Building Code Significant Changes Report

3103.1.1 Extended Period of Service 
Time

No amendment needed. Industry may want to 
make a proposal

No No Industry may provide a change proposal

30 Elevators and Conveying Systems

NO Significant Changes
31 Special Construction

Page 42 of 52



2024 International Building Code Significant Changes Report

3103.5 Bleachers No amendment needed. Industry may want to 
make a proposal

Yes No

3103.6 Structural Requirements No amendment needed. Industry may want to 
make a proposal

Yes No

3103.6.1 Structural Loads No amendment needed. Industry may want to 
make a proposal

Yes No

3103.6.1.1 Snow Loads No amendment needed. Industry may want to 
make a proposal

Yes No

Page 43 of 52



2024 International Building Code Significant Changes Report

T3103.6.1.1 Reduction Factors for Ground 
Snow Loads for public 
occupancy temporary 
structures

No amendment needed. Industry may want to 
make a proposal

No, reduction No

3103.6.1.3 Flood Loads No amendment needed. Industry may want to 
make a proposal

Yes No Coordinate with Fire TAG

3103.6.1.4 Seismic Loads No amendment needed. Industry may want to 
make a proposal

Yes No Coordinate with Fire TAG

3103.6.1.5 Ice Loads No amendment needed. Industry may want to 
make a proposal

Yes No Coordinate with Fire TAG

3103.6.1.6 Tsunami Loads No amendment needed. Industry may want to 
make a proposal

Yes No Coordinate with Fire TAG

3103.6.2 Foundations No amendment needed. Industry may want to 
make a proposal

Yes No Coordinate with Fire TAG

Page 44 of 52



2024 International Building Code Significant Changes Report

3103.6.3 Installation and Maintenance 
Inspections

No amendment needed. Industry may want to 
make a proposal

Yes No Coordinate with Fire TAG

3103.6.4 Durability No amendment needed. Industry may want to 
make a proposal

Yes No Coordinate with Fire TAG

3103.7 Servicability No amendment needed. Industry may want to 
make a proposal

Yes No Coordinate with Fire TAG

3103.8 Controlled Occupancy 
Procedures

No amendment needed. Industry may want to 
make a proposal

Yes No Coordinate with Fire TAG

32 Encroachments into the Public Right of Way

No Significant Changes
33 Safeguards During Construction

No Significant Changes
34 Reserved

Page 45 of 52



2024 International Building Code Significant Changes Report

ACI 440.11—22 Added reference to the standard "ACI 
440.11—22: Structural Concrete Buildings 
Reinforced Internally with Fiber Reinforced 
Polymer (FRP) Bars – Code Requirements", which 
is now referenced in IBC section 1901.2.1.  The 
code reference includes guidance for systems not 
previously in the IBC, therefore no cost increase. 

No No

AISC ANSI/AISC 370-21 Added reference to the standard "ANSI/AISC 
370—21: Specification for Structural Stainless 
Steel Buildings" , which is now referenced in IBC 
section 1705.2.2 and 2203.1.  The code reference 
includes guidance for systems not previously in 
the IBC, therefore no cost increase. 

No No

AISI AISI S310 Added reference to the standard "AISI S310—20 
w/S1—22: North American Standard for the 
Design of Profiled Steel Diaphragm Panels, with 
Supplement 1, 2022 Edition" , which is now 
referenced in IBC section 2204.1 and 2208.1.  
The code reference includes guidance for 
systems not previously in the IBC, therefore no 
cost increase. 

No No

ANSI E1.21—2020 Added reference to the standard "E1.21—2020: 
Entertainment Technology—Temporary 
Structures Used for Technical Production of 
Outdoor Entertainment Events" , which is now 
referenced in IBC section 3103.6.3 and 3103.8.  
The code reference includes guidance for 
systems not previously in the IBC, therefore no 
cost increase. 

No No

35 Referenced Standards

Page 46 of 52



2024 International Building Code Significant Changes Report

ANSI ES1.7—2021 Added reference to the standard "ES1.7—2021: 
Event Safety Requirements - Weather 
Preparedness" , which is now referenced in IBC 
section 3103.8.  The code reference includes 
guidance for systems not previously in the IBC, 
therefore no cost increase. 

No No

ASHRAE 90.1-2022 Added reference to the standard "90.1—2022: 
Energy Standard for Sites and Buildings Except 
Low-Rise Residential Buildings
1202.1", which is now referenced in IBC section 
1202.1.  The code reference includes guidance 
for systems not previously in the IBC, therefore 
no cost increase. 

No No

ASHRAE 170-2021 Added reference to the standard "170—2021: 
Ventilation of Health Care Facilities", which is 
now referenced in IBC section 1020.6.  The code 
reference includes guidance for systems not 
previously in the IBC, therefore no cost increase. 

No No

ASTM A641/A641M-19 Added reference to the standard "A641/A641M-
19: Specifications for Zinc-coated (Galvanized) 
Carbon Steel Wire", which is now referenced in 
IBC section 2304.10.6.  The code reference 
includes guidance for systems not previously in 
the IBC, therefore no cost increase. 

No No

ASTM C1902—20 Added reference to the standard "C1902—20: 
Standard Specification for Cellular Glass 
Insulation Used in Building and Roof 
Applications", which is now referenced in IBC 
section 1508.2 and Table 1508.2.  The code 
reference includes guidance for systems not 
previously in the IBC, therefore no cost increase. 

No No

Page 47 of 52



2024 International Building Code Significant Changes Report

ASTM D2737-21: Standard 
Specification for Polyethylene 
(PE) Plastic Tubing

Added reference to the standard "D2737-21: 
Standard Specification for Polyethylene (PE) 
Plastic Tubing".  The code reference includes 
guidance for systems not previously in the IBC, 
therefore no cost increase. 

No No

ASTM D5878-19 Added reference to the standard "D5878—19: 
Standard Guides for Using Rock-Mass 
Classification Systems for Engineering Purposes", 
which is now referenced in IBC section 1803.5.1.  
The code reference includes guidance not 
previously in the IBC, therefore no cost increase. 

No No

ASTM D6913/D6912M-17 Added reference to the standard 
"D6913/D6913M—17: Standard Test Methods 
for Particle-Size Distribution (Gradation) of Soils 
Using Sieve Analysis", which is now referenced in 
IBC section 1803.5.3.  The code reference 
includes guidance not previously in the IBC, 
therefore no cost increase. 

No No

ASTM D7793-20 Added reference to the standard "D7793—20: 
Standard Specification for Insulated Vinyl Siding", 
which is now referenced in IBC section 1403.14.  
The code reference includes guidance not 
previously in the IBC, therefore no cost increase. 

No No

ASTM D7957/D7957M Added reference to the standard 
"D7957/D7957M—17: Standard Specification for 
Solid Round Glass Fiber Reinforced Polymer Bars 
for Concrete Reinforcement", which is now 
referenced in IBC section 1901.2.1.  The code 
reference includes guidance not previously in the 
IBC, therefore no cost increase. 

No No

Page 48 of 52



2024 International Building Code Significant Changes Report

ASTM D8223-19 Added reference to the standard "D8223—19: 
Standard Practice for Evaluation of Fire-
Retardant Treated Laminated Veneer Lumber
2303.2.6.3", which is now referenced in IBC 
section 2303.2.6.3.  The code reference includes 
guidance not previously in the IBC, therefore no 
cost increase. 

No No

ASTM D8257/D8257M Added reference to the standard 
"D8257/D8257M—20: Standard Specification for 
Mechanically Attached Polymeric Roof 
Underlayment Used in Steep Slope Roofing", 
which is now referenced in IBC section 2507.1.1, 
Table 1506.1.1(1).  The code reference includes 
guidance not previously in the IBC, therefore no 
cost increase. 

No No

ASTM E2768-11(2018) Added reference to the standard 
"E2768—11(2018): Standard Test Method for 
Extended Duration Surface Burning 
Characteristics of Building Materials (30 min 
Tunnel Test)", which is now referenced in IBC 
section 2303.2.1.  The code reference includes 
guidance not previously in the IBC, therefore no 
cost increase. 

No No

ASTM E2837-2013(2017) Added reference to the standard 
"E2837—2013(2017): Standard Test Method for 
Determining the Fire Resistance of Continuity 
Head-of-Wall Joint Systems Installed Between 
Rated Wall Assemblies and Nonrated Horizontal 
Assemblies", which is now referenced in IBC 
section 715.6.  The code reference includes 
guidance not previously in the IBC, therefore no 
cost increase. 

No No

Page 49 of 52



2024 International Building Code Significant Changes Report

GA GA-253-2011 Added reference to the standard "GA-
253—2021: Application of Gypsum Sheathing", 
which is now referenced in IBC section Table 
2508.1, 2508.2.  The code reference includes 
guidance not previously in the IBC, therefore no 
cost increase. 

No No

MHI ANSI MH28.2-2022 Added reference to the standard "ANSI 
MH28.2—2022: Design, Testing and Utilization of 
Industrial Boltless Steel Shelving", which is now 
referenced in IBC section 2211.1.  The code 
reference includes guidance not previously in the 
IBC, therefore no cost increase. 

No No

MHI ANSI MH28.3-2022 Added reference to the standard "", which is now 
referenced in IBC section 2212.1.  The code 
reference includes guidance not previously in the 
IBC, therefore no cost increase. 

No No

MHI ANSI MH32.1-2018 Added reference to the standard "ANSI 
MH32.1—2018: Stairs, Ladders, and Open-Edge 
Guards for Use with Material Handling 
Structures", which is now referenced in IBC 
section 2213.1.  The code reference includes 
guidance not previously in the IBC, therefore no 
cost increase. 

No No

NFPA 770-21 Added reference to the standard "770—21: 
Standard on Hybrid (Water and Inert Gas) Fire-
Extinguishing Systems", which is now referenced 
in IBC section 904.13.  The code reference 
includes guidance not previously in the IBC, 
therefore no cost increase. 

No No

Page 50 of 52



2024 International Building Code Significant Changes Report

NFPA 780-20 Added reference to the standard "780—20: 
Standard for the Installation of Lightning 
Protection Systems", which is now referenced in 
IBC section 2703.2, 2703.21, 2703.3.  The code 
reference includes guidance not previously in the 
IBC, therefore no cost increase. 

No No

RMI ANSI MH16.1-2021 Added reference to the standard "ANSI 
MH16.1—2021: Design, Testing and Utilization of 
Industrial Storage Racks".  The code reference 
includes guidance not previously in the IBC, 
therefore no cost increase. 

No No

SDI ANSI/SDI SD-2022 Added reference to the standard "ANSI 
MH16.1—2021: Design, Testing and Utilization of 
Industrial Storage Racks", which is now 
referenced in IBC section 2208.1.  The code 
reference includes guidance not previously in the 
IBC, therefore no cost increase. 

No No

UL 96A-2016 Added reference to the standard "96A-2016: 
Standard for Installation Requirements for 
Lightning Protection Systems", which is now 
referenced in IBC section 2703.2, 2703.2.1, 
2703.3.  The code reference includes guidance 
not previously in the IBC, therefore no cost 
increase. 

No No

UL 1034-2011 Added reference to the standard "1034-2011: 
Burglary-Resistant Electric Locking 
Mechanisms—with Revisions through June 
2020", which is now referenced in IBC section 
1010.2.10, 1010.2.11, 1010.2.12.1, 1010.2.13, 
1010.2.14.  The code reference includes guidance 
not previously in the IBC, therefore no cost 
increase. 

No No

Page 51 of 52



2024 International Building Code Significant Changes Report

UL 8802-2020 Added reference to the standard "8802—2020: 
Outline of Investigation for Germicidal Systems", 
which is now referenced in IBC section 1211.1.  
The code reference includes guidance not 
previously in the IBC, therefore no cost increase. 

No No

WDMA WDMA I.S. 11-2018 Added reference to the standard "WDMA I.S. 
11—2018: Industry Standard for Analytical 
Method for Design Pressure (DP) Ratings of 
Fenestration Products", which is now referenced 
in IBC section 1709.5.  The code reference 
includes guidance not previously in the IBC, 
therefore no cost increase. 

No No

Appendix "Q"  Sleeping Lofts Renumber Appendix from P to Q No No

Appendix E Supplementary Accessibility Requirements

No Significant Changes
Appendix P Sleeping Lofts

Appendix Q Construction and Demolition Material Management Sleeping Lofts
2024 Code has new Appendix P WA Appendix P needs to be renumbered as Appendix Q

Page 52 of 52


	Significant Changes

